
TITLE 16 
 
 

FIRE PREVENTION 
 
 
CHAPTERS: 
 
16.05 Fire Codes 
16.07 Automatic Fire Alarm Systems 
16.12 Fire Regulations 
16.14 Recovery of Expenses 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.0 
October 2008 



Chapter 16.04, Uniform Fire Code and Chapter 16.06 Uniform Fire Code Standards were repealed in entirety 
by Ordinance No. 90-36.  Chapter 16.05, Fire Code, was repealed in entirety by Ordinance 12-52.  Past Fire 
Code regulations were codified with Ordinance Numbers 09-24, 02-152, 01-80, 00-122, 98-82, 96-49, 93-30, 
90-36, 89-146, 89-97, 86-61, 86-60, 82-134, 82-129 and 937. 
 

CHAPTER 16.05 
 

FIRE CODES 
 
Sections: 
16.05.010 Fire Code Adopted 
16.05.020 Marked Copies of Code on File 
16.05.030 Fire Department Inspection Division – Established Duties 
16.05.040 Section [A] 101.1 Amended – Title and Jurisdiction   
16.05.050 Subsection [A] 101.2.1 Amended – Appendices   
16.05.060 Section [A] 102.7 Amended – Referenced codes and standards 
16.05.065 Subsection [A] 102.13 Home child daycares 
16.05.070 Section 103 Deleted – Department of Fire Prevention    
16.05.080 Subsection [A] 105.1.1 Amended – Permits required   
16.05.090 Subsection [A] 105.3.1 Amended – Expiration   
16.05.100 Subsections [A] 105.6.1 through [A] 105.6.13, subsections [A] 105.6.15 through [A] 

105.6.19, subsections [A] 105.6.21 through [A] 105.6.29, and subsections [A] 105.6.31 
through [A] 105.6.46 Deleted – Certain required operational permits   

16.06.110 Subsection [A] 105.6.14 Amended – Explosives   
16.06.120 Subsection [A] 105.6.20 Amended – Hazardous materials   
16.06.130 Subsection [A] 105.6.30 Amended – Open burning 
16.06.140 Section [A] 109.4 Amended – Violation penalties   
16.06.150 Section 307 Amended – Open burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces 
16.05.160 Subsection 308.1.6.3 Added – Airborne flame devices   
16.05.170 Section 310.2 Amended – Prohibited areas   
16.05.180 Subsection 312.1.1 Added – Protection of utility equipment 
16.05.190 Section 403.3 Amended – Crowd managers   
16.05.200 Section 503.3 Marking   
16.05.210 Subsection 505.1.1 Added – Secondary address numbers   
16.05.220 Subsection 507.5.2.1 Added – Hydrants – Color   
16.05.230 Subsection 901.1.1 Added – Responsibility   
16.05.240 Section 901.4 Amended – Installation   
16.05.250 Subsection 901.4.5 Amended – Appearance of equipment   
16.05.260 Subsection 901.4.7 Added – Existing installations – supervision   
16.05.270 Subsection 901.6.3 Added – Test documentation   
16.05.280 Subsection 901.6.4 Added – Qualifications of inspection, testing and maintenance personnel 
16.05.290 Subsection 903.4.1 Amended – Monitoring   
16.05.300 Subsection 903.4.2 Amended – Alarms   
16.05.310 Subsection 907.6.5 Amended - Monitoring   
16.05.320 Subsection 907.7.4 Added – Contractor’s statement   
16.05.330 Section 912.2 Amended – Location   
16.05.340 Subsection 912.3.4 Added – Fire Department connections   
16.05.350 Section 1103.2 Deleted – Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings   
16.05.360 Section 1103.9 Deleted – Carbon monoxide alarms   
16.05.370 Section 1104.24 Deleted – Egress path markings   
16.05.380 Establishment of Above Ground Storage of Flammable Liquid Limits   
16.05.390 Establishment of Storage of Liquefied Petroleum Gas Limits   
16.05.400 Establishment of Explosives Storage Limits   
16.05.410 Code Official   
16.05.420 Civil Actions   
16.05.430 Liability   
 
 
 

16.1 
March 2014 



16.05.010 Fire Code Adopted.  The 2012 International Fire Code, published by the International Code 
Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795 is adopted by reference 
and made a part of this chapter as if fully set out, save and except such parts or portions thereof as are 
specifically deleted, added or changed in Sections 16.05.030 through and including 16.05.430.  (Ord. 12-52 § 
1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.020 Marked Copies of Code on File.   There shall be not less than one (1) copy of the code adopted 
by reference in Section 16.05.010 kept on file in the office of the City Clerk, to which shall be attached a 
copy of the incorporating ordinance, and which shall be marked or stamped, “Official Copy as Incorporated 
by Ordinance No. 12-52” with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted clearly marked to show 
any such deletion or change, and filed with the City Clerk and open to inspection and available to the public 
at all reasonable hours.  The Fire Department, Municipal Judges and all administrative departments of the 
City charged with the enforcement of the incorporating ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the City, 
such number of official copies of such standard ordinance similarly marked, deleted and changed as may be 
deemed expedient.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.030 Fire Department Inspection Division – Established Duties.  The Fire Code shall be enforced by 
the Community Risk Management Division in the Fire Department of the City of Olathe, which is established 
and which shall be operated under the supervision of the chief of the Fire Department.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 
 
16.05.040 Section [A] 101.1 Amended – Title and Jurisdiction.  Section [A] 101.1 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 101.1 Title and Jurisdiction.  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of 
Olathe, hereinafter referred to as the “International Fire Code” or “this code.”  The jurisdiction for 
this code is the corporate City limits of the City of Olathe, and territory outside the corporate limits 
for which the Fire Department contractually provides fire inspection services.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 

 
16.05.050 Subsection [A] 101.2.1 Amended – Appendices.  Subsection [A] 101.2.1 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 [A] 101.2.1 Appendices.  Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted. 
 

[A] 101.2.1.1 Appendices B, C, and D Adopted.  The following appendices contained in the 
International Fire Code are hereby adopted: 

 
  Appendix B – Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 
  Appendix C – Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution 
  Appendix D – Fire Apparatus Access Roads 
 
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.060 Section [A] 102.7 Amended – Referenced codes and standards.  Subsection [A] 102.7 
of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:  
 

[A] 102.7 Referenced codes and standards.  The codes and standards referenced in this code shall 
be those that are listed in Chapter 80 except as provided in Section [A] 102.7.3, and such codes and standards 
shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference and 
as further regulated in Sections [A] 102.7.1 and [A] 102.7.2. 

 
[A] 102.7.1 Differences.  Where differences occur between provisions of this code and referenced 

codes and standards, the most restrictive provisions shall apply. 
 
 
 
 
 

16.2 
March 2014 



[A] 102.7.2 Provisions in referenced codes and standards.  Where the extent of the reference to a 
referenced code or standard includes subject matter that is within the scope of this code, the most restrictive 
provisions, as applicable, shall take precedence over all other provisions. 

 
[A] 102.7.3 Amended codes and standards.  The standard reference numbers of the following 

codes and standards shall apply in lieu of the standard reference number of the same codes and standards 
listed in Chapter 80: 
 

NFPA 13-2013 (Installation of Sprinkler Systems) 
NFPA 13D-2013 (Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two-family Dwellings and 
Manufactured Homes) 
NFPA 13R-2013 (Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to and Including 
Four Stories in Height) 
NFPA 24-2013 (Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their Appurtenances) 
NFPA 72-2013 (National Fire Alarm Code) 
NFPA 495-2013 (Explosive Materials Code) 

 
[A] 102.7.3.1 Explosive Materials Code 
 

(a) The following provisions shall be excluded from NFPA 495-2013: 
 

(1) All material before chapter 1 and all annexes;  
(2) chapters 2, 8, and 12; 
(3) 

(A) The last sentence of section 1.3.1; 
(B) sections 1.4 through 1.4.3; and 
(C) section 1.6; 

(4) 
(A) The last sentence of section 3.1; 
(B) section 3.2.1; and 
(C) sections 3.2.3 through 3.2.7; 

(5) 
(A) Section 4.1.7; 
(B) sections 4.2.3.1 through 4.2.3.3;  
(C) sections 4.7.2 through 4.7.4; 
(D) section 4.8.2; and 
(E) section 4.10.2; 

(6) section 5.2.13.2; 
(7) 

(A) Sections 6.3 through 6.3.5; and 
(B) sections 6.6 through 6.6.8;  

(8) sections 7.3 through 7.3.2; 
(9) section 10.3.8.1; 
(10) section 11.4.3; 
(11) section 13.1.2; and 
(12) 

(A) Sections 14.1 through 14.3.8; 
(B) sections 14.4.1 through 14.4.4; and 
(C) sections 14.4.8 through 14.5.9. 

 
(b) The following modifications shall be made to NFPA 495-2013:  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.2.1 
March 2014 



(1) Section 1.3.2 shall be replaced with the following: “This code shall not apply to the 
transportation and use of military explosives by federal or state military agencies, nor shall this code apply to 
the use of explosive materials by federal, state, or municipal agencies while engaged in public safety 
functions, except that state and municipal agencies shall be subject to the storage, recordkeeping, and 
permitting requirements of this code.” 

(2) In section 1.3.5, the phrase “as defined in NFPA 1122, Code for Model Rocketry; NFPA 
1125, Code for the Manufacture of Model Rocket and High Power Rocket Motors; and NFPA 1127, Code for 
High Power Rocketry” shall be deleted. 

(3) The following text shall be added after section 1.3.6: 
“This code shall not apply to small arms ammunition and components of small arms 

ammunition, but this code shall apply to the manufacture of smokeless propellants and black powder 
substitutes and to smokeless propellants and black powder substitutes not designed for use in small arms 
ammunition. 

“This code shall not apply to commercially manufactured black powder in quantities not to 
exceed fifty pounds, percussion caps, safety and pyrotechnical fuses, quills, quick and slow matches, and 
friction primers, intended to be used solely for sporting, recreational, or cultural purposes in antique firearms 
as defined in 18 U.S.C. § 921(a)(16) or in antique devices exempted from the term ‘destructive device’ in 18 
U.S.C. § 921(a)(4). 

“This code shall not apply to the use, storage, or transportation of precursor chemicals used 
for agricultural purposes other than blasting, or to fertilizers and fertilizer materials regulated by the Kansas 
department of agriculture pursuant to K.S.A. 2-1201 et seq., and amendments thereto, except that thefts of 
ammonium nitrate shall be reported to the office of the state fire marshal and to a local law enforcement 
authority within 24 hours of discovering the theft.”  

(4) In section 3.2.2, the definition of “Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ)” shall be replaced 
with the following: “The state fire marshal or designee, except when the context indicates that the term is 
referring to a local fire department or law enforcement agency.”   

(5) In section 3.3.8, the definition of blasting agent shall be replaced with the following: 
“Any material or mixture, consisting of fuel and oxidizer, intended for blasting, not otherwise defined as an 
explosive, provided that the finished product, as mixed for use or shipment, cannot be detonated by means of 
a numbered 8 test blasting cap when unconfined.” 

(6) Section 3.3.20 shall be replaced with the following:  “Explosive.  Any chemical 
compound, mixture, or device, the primary or common purpose of which is to function by explosion. The 
term shall also include two or more precursor chemicals sold or possessed together that if mixed or combined 
would constitute a binary explosive.” 

(7) Section 3.3.49 shall be replaced with the following:  “Small arms ammunition and 
components of small arms ammunition.  Small arms ammunition or cartridge cases, primers, or smokeless 
propellants designed for use in small arms, including percussion caps, and 3/32 inch and other external 
burning pyrotechnic hobby fuses.  The term shall not include black powder, but shall include black powder 
substitutes provided the propellant is a component of small arms ammunition.” 

(8) Section 4.2.1 shall be replaced with the following: “No person shall be in possession of 
explosive materials, or conduct an operation or activity requiring the use of explosive materials, or perform 
or supervise the loading and firing of explosive materials without first obtaining the correct permit or permits 
from the state fire marshal.”  

(9) Section 4.2.4 shall be replaced with the following: “Each permitted manufacturer, 
distributor, and user in the state shall maintain continuous general liability coverage that includes coverage 
for intentional blasting of not less than $1,000,000 from an insurance company authorized by the Kansas 
insurance department to do business in Kansas and shall annually provide proof of this insurance to the state 
fire marshal.” 

(10) Section 4.3.1 shall be replaced with the following sentence: “Before a person conducts 
an operation or activity that uses explosive materials in the state, the person shall obtain a user permit from 
the state fire marshal.”   

(11) Section 4.3.2 shall be replaced with the following sentence: “Before an individual 
performs or supervises the loading and firing of explosive materials in the state, that individual shall obtain 
the appropriate permit to blast, as specified in Table 4.3.2, from the state fire marshal, except that this 
requirement shall not apply to a trainee who is acting under the direct supervision of and is being trained by 
the holder of a blaster permit.”  
 
 
 

16.2.2 
March 2014 



(12) The following classes of blasting permits shall be added to table 4.3.2:  
 

Class  Category    Blasting Permitted 
 
P1  Public Safety    Blasting by a bomb 
  Bomb Technician   technician acting on  
       behalf of the state or a 
       political or taxing sub- 
       division in a public 
       safety capacity 
 
P2  Public Safety    Explosive breaching  
  Explosive Breacher   by a person acting on  
       behalf of the state 
       or a political or taxing 
       subdivision in a public 
       safety capacity 
 

(13) The following text shall be added after section 4.3.2: 
“4.3.3 Permit to Manufacture.  Before a person manufactures explosive materials in the state, 
that person shall obtain a manufacturer permit from the state fire marshal.  A holder of a 
manufacturer permit shall not be required to obtain a distributor or user permit. 
 
“4.3.4 Permit to Distribute.  Before a person engages in the business of distributing explosive 
materials within the state, that person shall obtain a distributor permit from the state fire 
marshal, except that this requirement shall not apply to common carriers or to an out-of-state 
person who distributes explosive materials to the holder of a manufacturer or distributor 
permit.  ‘Distributing’ shall mean the selling, issuing, giving, transferring, or other disposing 
of.  A holder of a distributor permit shall not be required to obtain a user permit. 
  
“4.3.5 Handler Permit.  Before an individual, other than the holder of a blaster permit, 
actually or constructively possesses explosive materials in the state, that individual shall 
obtain a handler permit from the state fire marshal, except that a handler permit shall not be 
required to handle explosive materials under the direct supervision of the holder of a blaster 
permit.  ‘Direct supervision’ shall mean that the holder of the blaster permit is physically 
present and overseeing the actions of the employee.  Actual possession shall include the 
physical handling of explosive materials.  Permitted handlers may include individuals who 
load or unload vehicles, trainees, magazine keepers, drillers, stemmers and sales staff.  
  
“4.3.6 Storage Permit.  Before a person stores explosive materials in the state, that person 
shall obtain a site-specific storage permit.  The storage permit may be temporary or 
permanent.  A permanent storage permit shall be valid for no longer than three years.  A 
temporary storage permit shall be valid for no longer than 90 days, but the permit holder may 
apply to the office of the state fire marshal to renew the permit one time for no longer than an 
additional 90 days.  Before either storage permit will be issued, the person shall obtain a 
manufacturer, distributor, or user permit from the state fire marshal, any explosive permit 
required by the bureau of alcohol, tobacco, firearms and explosives, and a certification from 
the fire department with jurisdiction over the area where the storage site will be located that 
the proposed storage of explosive materials will not violate any local laws.” 
  
(14) Section 4.4.2.1 shall be replaced with the following: “Each applicant shall complete a 

blaster training program and pass a qualifying examination in the category of blasting for which application 
is made.  The blaster training program and qualifying examination shall be approved in advance by the office 
of the state fire marshal.  To be approved by the office of the state fire marshal, a blaster training program or 
blaster refresher course shall provide training on the following topics, as applicable to the category of 
blasting for which application is made: the requirements of this code; federal explosives law and regulations; 
and industry standards related to the safe use, storage, and transportation of explosive materials.” 
 
 

16.2.3 
March 2014 



(15) Section 4.4.2.2 shall be replaced with the following: “To be approved by the office of 
the state fire marshal, a qualifying examination shall test the applicant’s knowledge of the following topics, 
as applicable to the category of blasting for which application is made:  the requirements of this code; federal 
explosives law and regulations; and industry standards related to the safe use, storage, and transportation of 
explosive materials.” 

(16) Section 4.4.5 shall be replaced with the following: “Each person whose permit to blast 
has been revoked shall be required to complete a blaster training program and pass a qualifying examination 
as a condition of reinstatement of the permit.  The blaster training program and qualifying examination shall 
be approved in advance by the office of the state fire marshal.” 

(17) Section 4.4.6 shall be replaced with the following: “Each person whose permit to blast 
has lapsed for a period of one year or longer shall be required to complete a blaster training program and pass 
a qualifying examination as a condition of renewal of the permit.  The blaster training program and 
qualifying examination shall be approved in advance by the office of the state fire marshal.”  

(18) The following text shall be added after section 4.4.6:  
“If the holder of a blaster or handler permit ceases to be employed by a permitted 

manufacturer, distributor, or user, the blaster or handler shall notify the office of the state fire marshal within 
five business days, and the individual’s permit shall be placed on inactive status.  The individual shall not 
blast or handle explosive materials while the permit is on inactive status.  Before resuming work with a 
permitted manufacturer, distributor, or user, the blaster or handler shall notify the office of the state fire 
marshal, and the permit shall be returned to active status.  However, if the permit has been on inactive status 
for at least one year, the holder shall complete an approved blaster refresher class for a blaster permit or an 
approved explosive safety course for a handler permit before the permit is returned to active status.” 
 

“4.4.6.1 Requirement for a Handler Permit.  Before applying for or renewing a handler 
permit, an individual shall complete an explosive safety course approved by the state fire 
marshal.  The explosive safety course shall provide training on the safe handling, storage, 
and transportation of explosive materials.” 

 
(19) Sections 4.5.1 and 4.5.2 shall be replaced with the following sentence: “The holder of 

any permit or permits issued pursuant to this code shall maintain a copy of the permit or permits at all sites 
where explosive materials are stored or used and in any vehicle used to transport explosive materials.” 

(20) Section 4.6.2 shall be replaced with the following sentence: “An individual shall be at 
least 18 years old before applying for a handler permit and at least 21 years old before applying for a blaster 
permit.” 

(21) In section 4.7.1(3), “is a fugitive from justice” shall be replaced with “has fled from any 
state to avoid prosecution for a crime or to avoid giving testimony in any criminal proceeding.” 

(22) Section 4.8.1.1 shall be replaced with the following sentence:  “Permit holders shall 
keep records in accordance with 27 C.F.R. Part 555, Subpart G, as adopted by reference in Subsection [A] 
102.7.3.1.(d), herein.”   

(23) Section 4.10.1 shall be replaced with the following: “When an application for renewal is 
filed with the office of the state fire marshal before expiration of the current permit, the existing permit shall 
not expire until the state fire marshal has taken final action upon the application for renewal or, if the state 
fire marshal’s action is unfavorable, until the last day for seeking judicial review of the state fire marshal’s 
action or a later date fixed by the reviewing court.” 

(24) The following sentence shall be added after section 4.10.3:  “Before applying for 
renewal, the holder of a blaster permit shall complete a blaster refresher course approved by the state fire 
marshal and the holder of a handler permit shall complete an explosive safety course approved by the state 
fire marshal.”    

(25) Section 5.4.4.1.2 shall be replaced with the following: “The integrity of the fences and 
gates shall be checked at least annually.” 

(26) In section 5.4.7, the phrase “and the IAPMO Uniform Mechanical Code” shall be 
deleted. 

(27) Section 9.7.2 shall be replaced with the following: “All magazines containing explosive 
materials shall be opened and inspected at maximum intervals of seven days to determine whether there has 
been unauthorized or attempted entry into the magazines or whether there has been unauthorized removal of 
the magazines or their contents.” 
 
 
 

16.2.4 
March 2014 



(28) The following sentence shall be added before section 10.1: “A holder of a user permit 
shall notify the AHJ at least 48 hours before beginning blasting operations at a site and before resuming 
blasting operations at a site if those operations have been suspended or discontinued for more than six 
months.” 

(29) Section 10.1.19.1(2) shall be replaced with the following: “Compliance with the safe 
distances in safety library publication 20, ‘safety guide for the prevention of radio frequency radiation 
hazards in the use of commercial electric detonators (blasting caps),’ published by the institute of makers of 
explosives (IME) and dated December 2011, parts II and III of which are hereby adopted by reference, with 
the exception of all text before table 1 and pages 36 through 38.” 

(30) Section 11.1.1 shall be replaced with the following:  “This chapter shall apply to 
buildings and other structures.  As used in this chapter, ‘buildings and other structures’ shall mean dwellings, 
public buildings, schools, places of worship, and commercial or institutional buildings.”  

(31) In section 11.1.3, all text after “with” shall be replaced with “the international society of 
explosives engineers’ ‘ISEE performance specifications for blasting seismographs,’ 2011 edition.” 

(32) In section 11.1.4, the phrase “2009 edition” shall be added at the end of the sentence. 
(33) The following text shall be added after section 11.1.4:   
 
“The blaster-in-charge or designee shall conduct a preblast survey of all buildings and 
structures within a scaled distance of 35 ft/lbs1/2 from the blast site, except that a preblast 
survey shall not be required for a building or structure if the owner refuses permission or if 
the owner does not respond after three documented attempts to obtain permission. 
 
“Where blasting seismographs are used, the permitted user shall maintain the seismograph 
recording and accompanying records for at least three years.  These records shall include the 
maximum ground vibration and acoustics levels recorded, the specific location of the 
seismograph equipment, its distance from the detonation of the explosives, the date and time 
of the recording, the name of the individual responsible for operation of the seismograph 
equipment, the type of seismograph instrument, its sensitivity, and the calibration signal or 
certification date of the last calibration.” 

 
(34) Section 11.2.3 shall be replaced with the following sentence:  “The ground vibration 

limit for underground utilities, pipelines, fiber optic lines, and similar buried engineered structures shall be 
five inches per second.” 

(35) Section 11.4.2 shall be replaced with the following: “Reasonable precautions shall be 
taken to prevent flyrock from being propelled from the blast site onto property not contracted by the blasting 
operation or onto property for which the owner has not provided a written waiver to the blasting operation.” 

(36) The following text shall be added at the end of chapter 11: “The blaster-in-charge shall 
ensure that a record of each use of explosives is made, and this record shall be retained for at least three years 
by the permitted user.  The record shall include:  
 

“(A) The name and permit number of the permitted user; 
“(B) the location, date, and time of the detonation; 
“(C) the name and permit number of the blaster-in-charge; 
“(D) the type of materials blasted; 
“(E) the type of explosives used; 
“(F) the weight of each explosive product used and the total weight of explosives used; 
“(G) the maximum weight of explosives detonated within any eight-millisecond period; 
“(H) the initiation system, including the number of circuits and the timer interval, if a 
sequential timer is used; 
“(I) the type of detonator and delay periods used, in milliseconds; 
“(J) the sketch of delay pattern, including decking; 
“(K) the distance and scaled distance, if applicable, to the nearest building or structure;  
“(L) the location of the nearest building or structure, using the best available information; 
and 
“(M) if bore holes are used, the number of bore holes, burden, and spacing; the diameter and 
depth of bore holes; and the type and length of stemming.”  

 
 
 

16.2.5 
March 2014 



(37) Section 13.1.1 shall be replaced with the following sentence: “Two or more precursor 
chemicals that would constitute a binary explosive if mixed or combined shall be stored and used in the same 
manner as other explosive materials.”  

(38) Section 13.4.2 shall be replaced with the following: “Thefts of precursor chemicals 
during transportation, storage, and use shall be reported to the office of the state fire marshal, the bureau of 
alcohol, tobacco, firearms and explosives, and a local law enforcement agency.” 
 

(c) 
(1) Each citation in NFPA 495 to the following codes shall mean the edition adopted by 

reference in Chapter 16.05 of the Olathe Municipal Code: 
 

(A) NFPA 13, “standard for the installation of sprinkler systems”; and 
(B) NFPA 70, “national electric code.” 

 
(2) Each citation in NFPA 495 to the following codes shall mean the edition adopted by 

reference in Chapter 16.05 of the Olathe Municipal Code:  
 

(A) NFPA 1123, “code for fireworks display”; 
(B) NFPA 1124, “code for the manufacture, transportation, storage, and retail sales of 
fireworks and pyrotechnic articles”; and 
(C) NFPA 1126, “standard for the use of pyrotechnics before a proximate audience.” 

 
(3) Each citation of NFPA 1, “fire code,” shall be replaced by “the 2012 International Fire 

Code (IFC) as adopted by reference in Chapter 16.05 of the Olathe Municipal Code.” 
(4) Each citation of NFPA 5000, “building construction and safety code,” shall be replaced 

by “the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) as adopted by reference in Chapter 15.02 of the Olathe 
Municipal Code.” 
 

(d) 27 C.F.R. part 555, subpart G, as in effect on April 27, 2012, is hereby adopted by reference, with 
the following modifications: 
 

(1) 27 C.F.R. 555.121(b), 555.122, 555.123(f), 555.124(f), 555.125(a), (b)(2), and (b)(6), 
555.126, and 555.129 are not adopted. 

(2) In 27 C.F.R. 555.121(c), the last sentence shall be deleted. 
(3) In 27 C.F.R. 555.127, all text after “end of the day” shall be deleted.  
(4) In 27 C.F.R. 555.128, the last sentence shall be replaced with the following sentence: 

“Copies of the records shall be delivered to the office of the state fire marshal within 30 days following the 
discontinuance of the business or operations.”  

(5) Wherever the term “Director, Industry Operations” appears in subpart G, this term shall 
be replaced with “state fire marshal.” 

(6) Each reference to a “licensed manufacturer” shall mean a “person with a state 
manufacturer permit.”  Each reference to a “licensed dealer” shall mean a “person with a state distributor 
permit.”   

(7) Each reference to a “limited permit” shall be deleted. 
 

(e) Each existing user permit and each existing blaster permit issued by the state fire marshal shall be 
deemed valid and shall remain effective until the permit’s expiration date, unless the permit is revoked or 
suspended before then.  (Ord. 14-15 § 1, 2014; Ord. 13-13 § 1, 2013; Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.065  Subsection [A] 102.13 Home child daycares.  Home child daycares shall meet the requirements 
of the Johnson County, Kansas Home Daycare Handbook – 2013 Edition.  These homes shall be inspected 
and approved by the Fire Department before children are allowed to occupy the home.  The home shall be 
inspected by the Fire Department at least once every two years following the initial inspection.  (Ord. 14-15 § 
3, 2014.) 
 
 
 
 
 

16.2.6 
March 2014 



16.05.070  Section 103 Deleted – Department of Fire Prevention.   Section 103 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012) 
 
16.05.080 Subsection [A] 105.1.1 Amended – Permits required.  Subsection [A] 105.1.1 of the 
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 105.1.1 Permits required.  Any property owner or authorized agent who intends to conduct an 
operation or business, or install or modify systems and equipment which is regulated by this code, or 
to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the fire code official and obtain the 
required permits.  Issued permits shall be kept on the premises designated therein at all times and 
shall be readily available for inspection by Fire Department personnel upon request.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 

 
16.05.090 Subsection [A] 105.3.1 Amended – Expiration.  Subsection [A] 105.3.1 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 105.3.1 Expiration.  An operational permit shall remain in effect until reissued, renewed or 
revoked, or for such a period of time as specified in the permit.  Permits are not transferable and any 
change in occupancy, operation, tenancy or ownership shall require that a new permit be issued.  
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.100 Subsections [A] 105.6.1 through [A] 105.6.13, subsections [A] 105.6.15 through [A] 105.6.19, 
subsections [A] 105.6.21 through [A] 105.6.29, and subsections [A] 105.6.31 through [A] 105.6.46 
Deleted – Certain required operational permits.  Subsections [A] 105.6.1 through [A] 105.6.13, 
subsections [A] 105.6.15 through [A] 105.6.19, subsections [A] 105.6.21 through [A] 105.6.29, and 
subsections [A] 105.6.31 through [A] 105.6.46 of the International Fire Code are hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 
§ 1, 2012.) 
 
16.06.110 Subsection [A] 105.6.14 Amended – Explosives.  Subsection [A] 105.6.14 of the International 
Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 105.6.14 Explosives.  An operational permit is required for the manufacture, storage, handling, 
sale or use of any quantity of explosives, explosive materials, fireworks, pyrotechnic special effects 
or agricultural/wildlife control explosive device within the scope of Chapter 56 of this code.  The 
permit fee for explosives permits shall be adopted by the Governing Body of the City by resolution. 

 
Exception:  Storage in Group R-3 occupancies of smokeless propellant, black powder and small arms 
primers for personal use, not for resale and in accordance with Section 5606.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.06.120 Subsection [A] 105.6.20 Amended – Hazardous materials.  Subsection [A] 105.6.20 of the 
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.3 
March 2014 



[A] 105.6.21 Hazardous materials.  An operational permit is required to store, transport on site, 
dispense, use or handle hazardous materials in excess of the amounts listed in Table 105.6.20.  All 
hazardous materials permits shall be posted in a conspicuous location on the premises.  Permit fees 
for the hazardous materials permits shall be adopted by the Governing Body of the City by 
resolution.  A hazardous materials permit will be issued by the Fire Department on a yearly basis.  
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.06.130 Subsection [A] 105.6.30 Amended – Open burning.  Subsection [A] 105.6.30 of the 
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 105.6.30 Open burning.  An operational permit is required for the kindling or maintaining of an 
open fire or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or private ground.  Instructions and 
stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to.  Applications for open burning shall be obtained and 
submitted to the Olathe Fire Department before the fire is set and shall be in such form and contain such 
information as required by the Fire Department.  Residential and commercial permit fees shall be 
adopted by the Governing Body of the City by resolution.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.06.140 Section [A] 109.4 Amended – Violation penalties.  Section [A] 109.4 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

[A] 109.4 Violation Penalties.  Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in 
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, shall be guilty 
of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than Five Hundred Dollars ($500), or by 
imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days, or both such fine and imprisonment.  Each day that a 
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.  (Ord. 12-52 
§ 1, 2012.) 

 
16.06.150 Section 307 Amended – Open burning, Recreational Fires and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces.  
Section 307 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

SECTION 307 
OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES 
 
307.1 General.  A person shall not kindle or maintain or authorize to be kindled or maintained any 
open burning unless conducted and approved in accordance with Sections 307.1.1 through 307.5. 
 
307.1.1 Prohibited open burning.  Open burning shall be prohibited when atmospheric conditions 
or local circumstances make such fires hazardous. 
 

Exception:  Prescribed burning for the purpose of reducing the impact of wildland fire when 
authorized by the fire code official.   

 
307.1.2 Nature of material being burned.  The burning of heavy smoke producing materials is 
prohibited.  No processed construction wood products shall be burned. 
 
307.1.3 Meteorological conditions.  Open burning shall not be initiated until at least one hour after 
sunrise and shall be extinguished at least two hours prior to sunset.  Burning shall be restricted to 
periods when surface wind speed is more than 5 m.p.h and less than 15 m.p.h. 
  
307.1.4 Commercial open burning operations.  All commercial open burning permits will be 
required to have an air curtain destructor and pit. 
   
307.1.5 Open burning operations near airports.  All burning operations within 1 mile of an airport 
must obtain approval from the airport authority prior to the burning.   

 
 
 
 

16.4 
May 2013 



307.2 Permit required.  A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with 
Section 105.6 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range or wildlife management 
practices, prevention or control of disease or pests, or a bonfire.  Application of such approval shall 
only be presented by and permits issued to the owner of the land upon which the fire is to be kindled. 

 
307.2.1 Authorization.  Where required by state or local law or regulation, open burning shall only 
be permitted with prior approval from the state or local air and water quality management authority, 
provided that all conditions specified in the authorization are followed. 
 
307.2.2 Permit validity.  Open burning permits have an operational period of up to three (3) days as 
noted on the permit unless restricted by state or local authorities.  Permits shall not be transferrable. 
 
307.3 Extinguishment authority.  When open burning creates or adds to a hazardous situation, or a 
required permit for open burning has not been obtained, the fire code official is authorized to order 
the extinguishment of the open burning operation.   
 
307.4 Location.  The location for residential open burning shall not be less than one hundred (100) 
feet from any structure or public roadway.  Exceptions:  

 
1. Fires in approved containers that are not less than thirty (30) feet from a structure or 

public roadway. 
  
2. The minimum required distance from a structure or public roadway shall be fifty (50) 

feet where the pile size is three (3) feet or less in diameter and two (2) feet or less in 
height. 

  
307.4.1 Commercial open burning.  The location for commercial open burning shall not be less 
than one thousand (1,000) feet from any structure or public roadway, and provisions shall be made to 
prevent the fire from spreading to within one thousand (1,000) feet from any structure or public 
roadway. 
  
307.4.2 Bonfires.  A bonfire shall not be conducted within fifty (50) feet of a structure or 
combustible material.  Conditions which could cause a fire to spread with fifty (50) feet of a structure 
or combustible material shall be eliminated prior to ignition.  Bonfire dimensions shall not exceed six 
(6) feet in diameter and six (6) feet in height. 
 
307.4.3 Recreational fires.  Recreational fires shall not be conducted within twenty-five (25) feet of 
a structure or combustible material.  Conditions which would cause a fire to spread within twenty-
five (25) feet of a structure or combustible material shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 
 
307.4.4 Portable outdoor fireplaces, Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used In accordance with 
the manufacturer’s instructions and shall not be operated within fifteen (15) feet of a structure or 
combustible material.   
 

Exception:  Portable outdoor fireplaces used at one- and two-family dwellings.   
 

307.5 Attendance.  Open burning, bonfires, recreational fires and the use of portable outdoor 
fireplaces shall be constantly attended until the fire is extinguished.  A minimum of one (1) portable 
fire extinguisher complying with Section 906 with a minimum 4-A rating or other approved on-site 
fire-extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water barrel, garden hose or water truck, shall be 
available for immediate utilization.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.160 Subsection 308.1.6.3 Added – Airborne flame devices.  Subsection 308.1.6.3 is hereby added to 
the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

308.1.6.3 Airborne flame devices.  Devices with an open flame that are independently buoyant and 
float uncontrolled shall be prohibited.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
 

16.5 
May 2013 



16.05.170 Section 310.2 Amended – Prohibited areas.  Section 310.2 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

310.2 Prohibited areas.  Smoking shall be prohibited as set forth in Chapter 6.20 of the Olathe 
Municipal Code. 

 
Exception:  Smoking shall be permitted in approved designated smoking areas as set forth in Chapter 6.20 of 
the Olathe Municipal Code.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.180 Subsection 312.1.1 Added – Protection of utility equipment.  Subsection 312.1.1 is hereby 
added to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

312.1.1 Protection of utility equipment.  Where meters and equipment supplying electricity or fuel 
gas are located adjacent to parking spaces or vehicular driveways, they shall be protected from 
physical damage.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.190 Section 403.3 Amended – Crowd managers.  Section 403.3 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

403.3 Crowd managers.  Trained crowd managers shall be provided for facilities or events where 
more than one thousand (1,000) persons congregate.  The minimum number of crowd managers shall 
be established at a ratio of one crowd manager to every two hundred fifty (250) persons.  Where 
approved by the fire code official, the ratio of crowd managers shall be permitted to be reduced 
where the facility is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system or based upon 
the nature of the event.  The fire code official may, based on the nature of the event, require the event 
to use Fire Department personnel as crowd managers.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.200 Section 503.3 Marking.  Section 503.3 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows: 
 

503.3 Marking.  Where required by the Fire Department, approved signs or other approved notices 
shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction 
thereof.  Signs or notices shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times and be 
replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.   

 
503.3.1 Marking requirements.  Each separate fire lane signage, which may consist of one sign or a 
combination of signs, shall have a cumulative minimum size of ninety six (96) square inches and 
contain the “No Parking” words or symbol with the words “Fire Lane” located directly beneath the 
“No Parking” words or symbol.  Each sign or combination of signs are required to be uniformly 
mounted between two feet eight inches (2’8”) to seven feet zero inches (7’0”) above grade to the 
bottom of the sign, and so located not to obstruct pedestrian traffic.  The sign or combination of signs 
shall be mounted within six feet (6’) of the curb or pavement and are required to face or run parallel 
with oncoming vehicular traffic.  The sign or combinations of signs may be mounted on the building, 
pole base or any other structure provided the signage meets the setback and height requirements 
indicated above.  The sign or combination of signs are required to be spaced no more than one 
hundred feet (100’) apart.  In addition, the curb, or pavement if a curb is absent, is required to be 
marked with a solid yellow stripe that runs the entire length of the fire lane.  Furthermore, the 
exceeding of any standards intended to inform the public of the location of a fire lane shall not affect 
the enforcement of this section.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6 
April 2013 



16.05.210 Subsection 505.1.1 Added – Secondary address numbers.  Subsection 505.1.1 is hereby added 
to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

505.1.1 Secondary address numbers.  Multi-tenant retail shopping centers in which tenant spaces 
have secondary entry doors from the exterior façade of the building and have paved vehicle access 
adjacent to such doors shall have approved numbers or addresses placed on or adjacent to each door.  
Secondary address numbers shall be a minimum of four inches (4”) in height.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 

 
16.05.220 Subsection 507.5.2.1 Added – Hydrants – Color.  Subsection 507.5.2.1 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

507.5.2.1 Hydrants – Color.  All hydrants shall be painted and highly visible.  Private fire hydrants 
shall be painted red in color.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.230 Subsection 901.1.1 Added – Responsibility.  Subsection 901.1.1 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.1.1 Responsibility.  The owner of the protected premises shall be responsible for all fire 
protection systems within the protected premises, whether existing or installed under this code.  (Ord. 
12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.240 Section 901.4 Amended – Installation.  Section 901.4 of the International Fire Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 
 

901.4 Installation.  Fire protection systems shall be maintained in accordance with the original 
installation standards for that system.  All systems shall be extended, altered, or augmented as 
necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever the building is altered, remodeled or added 
to.  Alterations to fire protection systems shall be done in accordance with applicable standards.  
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.250 Subsection 901.4.5 Amended – Appearance of equipment.  Subsection 901.4.5 of the 
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

901.4.5 Nonoperational equipment.  Any fire protection equipment that is no longer in service shall 
be removed.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.260 Subsection 901.4.7 Added – Existing installations – supervision.  Subsection 901.4.7 is hereby 
added to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.4.7 Existing installations – supervision.  All existing fire suppression and fire alarm systems 
shall be supervised in conformance with Sections 903.4 and 907.9.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.270 Subsection 901.6.3 Added – Test documentation.  Subsection 901.6.3 is hereby added to 
the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 

 
901.6.3 Test documentation. When required inspection, testing or maintenance occurs on 
any existing fire protection system, applicable testing documentation shall be submitted to 
the fire code official within thirty (30) days of completion through an approved third-party 
inspection reporting system.  Reporting parties shall pay any fees associated with that service 
to the City’s third-party service provider.  (Ord. 15-35 § 1, 2015; Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.1 
July 2015 



16.05.280 Subsection 901.6.4 Added – Qualifications of inspection, testing and maintenance personnel.  
Subsection 901.6.4 is hereby added to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.6.4 Qualifications of inspection, testing and maintenance personnel.  All personnel 
performing any inspection, testing or maintenance of any fire protection system shall be qualified.  
Where such inspection, testing and maintenance is performed by an outside service company, the 
company shall be appropriately licensed in accordance with the Office of the Kansas State Fire 
Marshal.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.290 Subsection 903.4.1 Amended – Monitoring.  Subsection 903.4.1 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

903.4.1 Monitoring.  Alarm, waterflow, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different 
and shall be automatically transmitted to an approved UL-listed central station as defined in NFPA 
72, or, when approved by the fire code official, shall sound an audible signal at a constantly attended 
location.  The fire alarm system installed to transmit such signals shall be considered a building fire 
alarm system and shall be documented as a UL-certificated central station service system. 

 
Exceptions: 
 

1. Underground key or hub valves in roadway boxes provided by the municipality or public 
utility are not required to be monitored.  

 
2. Backflow prevention device test valves located in limited area sprinkler system supply piping 

shall be locked in the open position.  In occupancies required to be equipped with a fire 
alarm system, the backflow preventer valves shall be electrically supervised by a tamper 
switch installed in accordance with NFPA 72 and separately annunciated.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 

 
16.05.300 Subsection 903.4.2 Amended – Alarms.  Subsection 903.4.2 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

903.4.2 Alarms.  One all-weather horn/strobe shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler system 
on the exterior of the building above the Fire Department connection or in an approved location.  
Such sprinkler system water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the 
flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system.  Where a fire alarm 
system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm 
system.  Interior alarm notification appliances shall be installed as required by Section 903.4.2.1. 

 
903.4.2.1 Notification devices.  Where an automatic fire sprinkler system is installed in a building, 
audible and visible notification appliances shall be installed throughout the building as follows: 

 
1. Audible notification appliances shall be installed so as to be audible at 15 dBa above 

sound pressure level throughout the building. 
 
2. Visible notification appliances shall be installed in all public and common use areas, 

restrooms and corridors in accordance with the spacing requirements of NFPA 72. 
 
3. Visible notification devices can be eliminated in normally unoccupied portions of 

buildings where permitted by the fire code official.   
 
Exception:  The requirements of this section do not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.2 
April 2013 



16.05.310 Subsection 907.6.5 Amended - Monitoring.  Subsection 907.6.5 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

907.6.5 Monitoring.  Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the International Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved supervising station in accordance with NFPA 72.  An 
Underwriters Laboratories (UL) Fire Alarm certificate shall be issued by the UL listed fire alarm 
contractor for all newly installed fire alarm system or existing fire alarm systems included in any 
existing building involved in any construction project involving a building permit.  Any fire alarm 
system involved in one (1) or more false alarms within the same calendar year shall be subject to a 
fee in accordance with Section 16.07.070 of the Olathe Municipal Code.  Any fire alarm system 
involved in four (4) or more false alarms within the same calendar year will be required to meet the 
monitoring requirements of new fire alarm systems, including the issuance of a UL fire alarm 
certificate.  The Fire Department shall maintain a listing of approved UL listed fire alarm contractors. 

 
Exception:  Monitoring by a supervising station is not required for: 
 

1. Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms required by Section 907.2.11. 
 
2. Smoke detectors in Group I-3 occupancies. 
 
3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dwellings.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.320 Subsection 907.7.4 Added – Contractor’s statement.  Subsection 907.7.4 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

907.4.4 Contractor’s statement.  A contractor’s statement verifying that the system has been 
installed in accordance with the approved plans and specifications and has been one hundred percent 
(100%) tested in accordance with NFPA 72.  The statement will also include that all personnel 
involved with the installation of the fire alarm system meet the qualification requirements of the fire 
code official.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.330 Section 912.2 Amended – Location.  Section 912.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 
 

912.2 Location.  With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, Fire Department 
connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will not 
obstruct access to the buildings for other fire apparatus.  The location of Fire Department 
connections shall be approved by the fire code official.  A Fire Department connection for each 
standpipe system or water-based fire-extinguishing system shall be located not more than one 
hundred feet (100’) from the nearest public fire hydrant connection to an approved water supply.  
Private fire hydrants are not approved to supply water-based fire-extinguishing systems.  (Ord. 12-52 
§ 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.340 Subsection 912.3.4 Added – Fire Department connections.  Subsection 912.3.4 is hereby added 
to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

912.3.4 Fire Department connections.  The connection shall be a four inch (4”) Storz quick 
coupling connector.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.350 Section 1103.2 Deleted – Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings.  Section 
1103.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.360 Section 1103.9 Deleted – Carbon monoxide alarms.  Section 1103.9 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.3 
April 2013 



16.05.370 Section 1104.24 Deleted – Egress path markings.  Section 1104.24 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.380 Establishment of Above Ground Storage of Flammable Liquid Limits.  The limits referred to 
in Subsection 5704.2.9.6.1 of the International Fire Code in which storage of flammable or combustible 
liquids in outside above-ground tanks is prohibited are established as follows: any residential, commercial, or 
M-1 zoning district.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.390 Establishment of Storage of Liquefied Petroleum Gas Limits.  The limits referred to in Section 
6104.2 of the International Fire Code in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted are established 
as follows:  any residential or commercial zoning district.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.400 Establishment of Explosives Storage Limits.  The limits referred to in Subsection 5601.2.3 of 
the International Fire Code in which storage of explosive and blasting agents is prohibited, excepting 
temporary job sites, are as follows:  any residential, commercial, or M-1 zoning district.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 
 
16.05.410 Code Official.  The Fire Chief of the City of Olathe or his or her designee shall be designated the 
enforcement officer of this code and is herein referred to as the fire code official for the purposes of this 
chapter.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.420 Civil Actions.  Notwithstanding the provisions of Section 101.5, the decisions of the Fire Chief or 
the decisions of the Board of Code Review reviewing the decisions of the Fire Chief shall be enforceable in 
the District Court of Johnson County, Kansas, or any other court of competent jurisdiction upon action 
brought by the City Attorney, or such other legal counsel authorized to maintain such action for enforcement 
of the provisions of this chapter.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.430 Liability.  The requirements stated in this chapter shall not be construed as imposing upon the 
City, its officers, agents or employees any liability or responsibility for damages to any property or injury to 
any person due to defective installations.  The City or any official, employee or agent thereof shall not 
assume liability or responsibility whatsoever by reason of any inspection or approval of any installation.  
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.4 
April 2013 



CHAPTER 16.07 
 

AUTOMATIC FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS 
 
 
 

Sections: 
16.07.010 Definitions 
16.07.020 Registration of Fire Alarm Systems 
16.07.030 System Certification 
16.07.040 Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance 
16.07.050 Fire Alarm Activation Response 
16.07.060 Nuisance Fire Alarm 
16.07.070 False or Nuisance Fire Alarm Fees 
16.07.080 Remedies and Penalties 
16.07.090 Appeals 
16.07.100 Reconnection of Fire Alarm System 
16.07.110 Government Immunity 
16.07.120 Severability 
 
16.07.010 Definitions.  For the purposes of this Chapter, the following words and terms shall have the 
following meanings: 

 
A. “Adopted Codes” means codes adopted by the City of Olathe, the National Fire Protection 

Association Fire Alarm Code (NFPA 72) and the International Fire Code (IFC). 
 
B. “Alarm Initiating Device” means a device that is designed to respond either manually or 

automatically to smoke, fire, or activation of a fire suppression system. 
 
C. “Enforcement Official” means the Fire Chief or designated representative. 
 
D. “False Fire Alarm” means the activation of any Fire Alarm System which results in a 

response by the fire department and which is caused by the negligence or intentional misuse of the Fire 
Alarm System by the Owner, its employees, agents, or any other activation of a Fire Alarm System not 
caused by heat, smoke, or fire, exclusive of a Nuisance Fire Alarm. 

 
E. “Fee” means the assessment of a monetary charge payable to the City of Olathe to defray the 

expenses of responding to a False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm. 
 
F. “Fire Alarm Activation Report” means a document issued by the Enforcement Officer 

indicating that the activation was deemed to be a result of a fire alarm activation due to fire, a Nuisance Fire 
Alarm, or a False Fire Alarm. 

 
G. “Fire Alarm Business” means any individual, partnership, corporation, or other entity that is 

appropriately licensed to conduct business in the State of Kansas and installs, causes to be installed, permits 
to be installed, alters, maintains, repairs, replaces, or services (including Runner Services) any Fire Alarm 
System. 

 
H. “Fire Alarm System” means a system or portion of a combination system consisting of 

components and circuits arranged to monitor and/or communicate the status of a fire alarm or supervisory 
signal-initiating devices and to initiate the appropriate response to those signals. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.7 
October 2008 



I. “Fire Watch” means an approved person or persons assigned to the Premises for the purpose 
of protecting the occupants from fire or similar emergencies. A Fire Watch may involve at least some special 
action beyond normal staffing, such as assigning additional staff to walk the Premises, who has been 
specially trained in fire prevention and in the use of fire extinguishers, in notifying the fire department, in 
sounding the Fire Alarm System located on the Premises, and in understanding the particular fire safety 
situation.  

 
J. “Monitored System” means the process by which a Fire Alarm Business receives signals 

from a Fire Alarm System and notifies emergency forces. 
 
K. “Nuisance Fire Alarm” means the activation of any Fire Alarm System, which results in a 

response by the fire department, caused by mechanical failure, malfunction, improper installation, lack of 
proper maintenance, or any other response for which fire department personnel are unable to determine the 
apparent cause of the alarm activation. 

 
L. “Owner” means any person who owns the Premises in which a Fire Alarm System is 

installed or the person or persons who lease, operate, occupy, or manage the Premises. 
 
M. “Premises” means any building, structure, or combination of buildings and structures which 

serve as dwelling units such as single-family, multi-family, or any other area within a building, structure, or 
combination thereof which is used for any purpose, wherein a Fire Alarm System is installed. 

 
N. “Qualified Fire Alarm Technician” means any person who inspects, installs, repairs, or 

performs maintenance on Fire Alarm Systems. This person shall be: a) factory trained and certified, b) 
National Institute of Certification in Engineering Technologies (NICET) Fire Alarm Level II certified, or c) 
employed by a UL UUFX or UUJS listed fire alarm company. 

 
O. “Record of Completion” means the completion of a form equivalent to the record of 

completion form included in the National Fire Protection Association’s National Fire Alarm Code (NFPA 
72). 

 
P. “Registration” means the notification by an Owner to the Enforcement Official that a Fire 

Alarm System has been installed and is in use. 
 
Q. “Report of Service/Repair” means appropriate documentation in a format acceptable to the 

Enforcement Official that verifies proper repairs or maintenance have been performed by both the Fire Alarm 
Business and the Owner. 

 
R. “Runner Service” means the service provided by a runner at the protected premises, 

including resetting and silencing of all equipment transmitting fire alarm or supervisory signals to an off-
premises location. 

 
S. “Serve” shall mean hand-delivery of written notification by a representative of the City of 

Olathe to the Owner or authorized representative who responded to the Premises. In the event the Owner or 
authorized representative fails to respond to the Premises within one (1) hour, Serve shall mean placing the 
form or other matter in the United States mail, postage prepaid, addressed to the Owner or authorized 
representative.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.020 Registration of Fire Alarm System. 
 

A. An annual Registration shall be required for all Fire Alarm Systems and whenever new Fire 
Alarm Systems are installed, in accordance with Adopted Codes. 

 
B. The Owner shall be required to re-register whenever there is a change in the Fire Alarm 

Business responsible for maintaining, servicing, and/or monitoring the Fire Alarm System. 
 
 
 
 

16.8 
October 2008 



C. Registration shall not be transferable from one Premises to another or from one Owner to 
another.  

 
D. Every Fire Alarm Business shall notify the Enforcement Official of the existence of a Fire 

Alarm System prior to the Fire Alarm System being put into service. It shall be the responsibility of the 
installing Fire Alarm Business to provide the Owner with notice of the existence of this Chapter, a 
Registration form and a copy of the Fire Alarm System operation instructions in accordance with Adopted 
Codes, and the manufacturer’s instructions. 

 
E. The Registration form shall include the following information: 

 
1. The name(s), address of the Premises, mailing address (if different from the address 

of the Premises), business and home telephone number of the Owner, lessee, operator, manager, or 
person in possession of the Premises wherein the Fire Alarm System is installed; 

2. The name, address, and telephone number of a minimum of two (2) persons who can 
be notified by the Enforcement Official, in the event of the activation of the Fire Alarm System, who 
shall be capable of responding to the Premises within one (1) hour, and who are authorized to enter 
the Premises to ascertain the status thereof; 

3. The name, address, and telephone number of the Fire Alarm Business which has 
contracted to service the Fire Alarm System and proof of proper qualification with the Enforcement 
Official, if required.  

4. The date the Registration is signed or the Fire Alarm System is placed in operation 
for any reason; and  

5. Any other documentation that is required by Adopted Codes. 
 
F. When any of the information required by this Chapter has changed, it shall be reported to the 

Enforcement Official by the Owner within fifteen (15) days of the Owner becoming aware of such change; 
 
G. The Owner shall complete and deliver the Fire Alarm System Registration in the required 

format to the Enforcement Official before the Fire Alarm System is activated or placed into service. The Fire 
Alarm Business, when authorized by the Owner, may assist the Owner in accomplishing this submission of 
the Fire Alarm Registration to the Enforcement Official. 

 
H. An Owner who does not renew the annual registration shall be subject to a non-renewal fee.  
 
I. The fire alarm registration Fee and non-renewal fee shall be adopted by resolution of the 

Governing Body.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.030 System Certification.  All newly installed or renovated commercial Fire Alarm Systems shall be 
approved by the Enforcement Official. The certification shall indicate that the Fire Alarm System is in 
compliance with Adopted Codes. All new or renovated commercial Fire Alarm Systems shall be certificated 
by Underwriters Laboratories.  (UL)  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.040 Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance. 
 

A. The Owner shall ensure that all Fire Alarm Systems are inspected and tested in accordance 
with Adopted Codes. 

 
B. The Owner shall ensure that all Fire Alarm Systems are periodically maintained per 

manufacturer specifications and Adopted Codes.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.050 Fire Alarm Activation Response. 
 

A. The Owner shall be responsible for the activation of a Fire Alarm System. 
 
 
 
 
 

16.9 
October 2008 



B. A response to the activation of a Fire Alarm System shall result when any officer or member 
of the Fire Department is dispatched to the Premises where the Fire Alarm System has been activated. 

 
1. At the time of the response, the Enforcement Official shall notify any person 

identified in the Registration required by this Chapter and shall require such person to respond to the 
Premises. 

2. In the event the Fire Alarm System is a Monitored System, it is the responsibility of 
the company monitoring the Fire Alarm System to notify any persons identified in the Registration at 
the request of the Enforcement Official. 

3. In the event the Fire Alarm System is a Monitored System, it is the responsibility of 
the Fire Alarm Business to offer the Owner the option to verify the Fire Alarm signal before 
dispatch, as allowed by Adopted Code. 

4. In the event the Fire Alarm System is a Monitored System, it is the responsibility of 
the Fire Alarm Business to forward cancellation of a Fire Alarm signal to the fire department. 

 
C. The officer or member of the fire department who responded to said Premises shall Serve the 

Owner or authorized representative with a Fire Alarm Activation Report.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.060 Nuisance Fire Alarms. 
 

A. In the event the activation of a Fire Alarm System is deemed by the Enforcement Official to 
be a Nuisance Fire Alarm, the Owner shall be Served with a Fire Alarm Activation Report by an officer or 
member of the fire department, indicating that the activation was deemed to be the result of a Nuisance Fire 
Alarm. 
 

1. This shall require the Owner to return the completed Report of Service/Repair within 
fifteen (15) days of receipt of the Fire Alarm Activation Report to verify, to the reasonable 
satisfaction of the Enforcement Official , that: 

 
a. the Fire Alarm System has been examined by a Qualified Fire Alarm 

Technician; and 
b. a bona fide attempt has been made to identify and correct any defect of 

design, installation, or operation of the Fire Alarm System which was identifiable as the 
cause of the Nuisance Fire Alarm. 

 
2. Any owner who fails to return a Report of Service/Repair within said fifteen (15) day 

period, which is reasonably satisfactory to the Enforcement Official, shall be subject to a Fee for the 
Nuisance Fire Alarm.  Such Fee shall be adopted by resolution of the Governing Body.  (Ord. 08-80 
§ 1, 2008) 

 
16.07.070 False Fire Alarm Fees. 
 

A. Newly Installed Fire Alarms. 
 

1. The provisions of this Section shall only apply to any newly installed Fire Alarm 
System after the expiration of a period of thirty (30) days from the date of final inspection, but shall 
apply from and after the expiration of the initial thirty (30) day period following final inspection. 

 
B. False Fire Alarms. 

 
1. The Fire Alarm Business shall be assessed a Fee if an Enforcement Official 

determines that a False Fire Alarm was directly caused by an onsite employee or representative  of 
the Fire Alarm Business. In this event, no False Fire Alarm shall be counted against the Owner. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

16.10 
October 2008 



2. Any Fire Alarm System which has recorded more than one (1) False Fire Alarm 
within a calendar year will be subject to a Fee.  Such Fee shall be adopted by resolution of the 
Governing Body. 

3.  False Fire Alarms activated by any components connected to the Fire Alarm System 
shall be included in computing the total number of False Fire Alarms for purposes of this subsection. 

4.  The activation of a Fire Alarm System will not be considered a False Fire Alarm if 
the alarm is activated due to malicious causes beyond the control of the Owner.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 
2008) 

 
16.07.080 Remedies and Penalties. 
 

A. The Enforcement Official has the authority to order a Fire Watch in accordance with 
Adopted Codes, due to repetitive Nuisance Fire Alarms and/or False Fire Alarms, until corrective action is 
taken for any of the following reasons: 
 

1. Failure to meet all requirements or pay the Fees provided for in this Chapter with 
fifteen (15) days after the notice is mailed to the Owner; 

2. Failure of the Owner to provide a written Report of Service/Repair required by this 
Chapter; 

3. A second False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm at a Premises for which a Fee is 
charged pursuant to this Chapter as a result of the failure of the Owner to take corrective action to 
eliminate the cause of the False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm; or 

4. The failure of a person notified pursuant to Section 16.07.020(E)(2) and Section 
16.07.050(B)(2) to appear within one (1) hour after being notified to respond, if such failure to 
timely respond occurs four or more times within a calendar year. 

 
B. Each building affected because the signal from the Fire Alarm System has been disconnected 

or deactivated shall be required to establish a Fire Watch until the Fire Alarm System has been returned to 
service. Duties of the Fire Watch may include notifying the fire department and building occupants of an 
emergency, preventing a fire from occurring, or extinguishing small fires. These duties shall be documented 
on a Fire Watch log every hour until the Fire Alarm System has been restored to normal service. 
 

C. The Owner is responsible for paying all costs associated with establishing a Fire Watch. 
 
D. The Enforcement Official has the authority to temporarily suspend the occupancy of a 

Premises until all outstanding repairs are made on the Fire Alarm System or if the Fire Watch log is not 
maintained to the satisfaction of the Enforcement Official. 

 
E. The Enforcement Official shall have the authority to direct the Owner of the Premises to 

silence an activated Fire Alarm System, have corrective action taken and thereafter reset it. 
 
F. Anyone convicted of falsifying reports as required under this Chapter is subject to maximum 

penalty in accordance with Section 9.08.090.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.090 Appeals. 
 

A. The Owner or Fire Alarm Business may appeal an assessment of a Fee by setting forth in 
writing the reasons for the appeal within fifteen (15) business days after receipt of the Fee. 

 
B. Filing of a request for appeal shall stay the Fee until the review of the appeal has been 

completed. If a request for appeal is not made within the fifteen (15) business day period, the action of the 
Enforcement Official is final. 

 
C. The Enforcement Official may adjust the count of False Fire Alarms or Nuisance Fire 

Alarms based on: 
 
 
 
 

16.11 
October 2008 



1. Evidence that the alarm was caused by an act of God; 
2. Evidence that the alarm was caused by action of the telephone company: 
3. Evidence that the alarm was caused by a power outage lasting longer than four (4) 

hours; 
4. Evidence that the alarm was not a False or Nuisance Fire Alarm; and/or 
5. In determining the number False or Nuisance Fire Alarms occurring in any twenty 

four (24) hour period shall be counted as one False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm; to allow the 
Owner time to take corrective action unless the alarms are directly caused by the Owner.  (Ord. 08-80 
§ 1, 2008) 

 
16.07.100 Reconnection of Fire Alarm System. 
 

A. A Fire Alarm System may be reactivated upon a finding by the Enforcement Official that the 
Owner of the Premises has taken corrective action to remedy the cause of the False Fire Alarm or Nuisance 
Fire Alarm at the Premises. 

 
B. In making a request for such a reactivation, the Owner shall have the burden of showing what 

corrective action has been made. 
 
C. The Enforcement Official shall have the right to inspect the Fire Alarm System and test it 

prior to approving a new order to reconnect or reactivate the Fire Alarm System. 
 
D. The Enforcement Official shall not approve a new order to reconnect or reactivate if the 

Owner has failed to pay any Fee pursuant to this Chapter.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.110 Government Immunity.  Registration of a Fire Alarm System is not intended to, nor will it, create 
a contract, duty or obligation, either expressed or implied, or response. Any and all liability and 
consequential damage resulting from the failure to respond to a notification is hereby disclaimed and 
governmental immunity as provided by law is retained. When registering a Fire Alarm System, the Owner 
acknowledges that fire department response may be based on factors such as; availability of fire department 
units, priority of calls, weather conditions, traffic conditions, emergency conditions, and staffing levels. The 
City of Olathe, its officers, employees and agents shall not assume any duty or responsibility for the 
installation, maintenance, operation, repair or effectiveness of any privately owned Fire Alarm System, those 
duties or responsibilities being solely those of the Owner of the Premises.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.120 Severability.  The provisions of this Chapter are severable. If a court determines a word, phrase, 
clause, sentence, paragraph, subsection, section, or other provision invalid or that the application of any part 
of the provision to any person or circumstance is invalid, the remaining provision and the application of those 
provisions to other persons or circumstances are not affected by that decision.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
CHAPTER 16.08.  Life Safety Code.  Repealed  (Ord. 90-36 § 1, 1990; Ord. 86-62 § 1, 2, 1986.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.12 
October 2008 



CHAPTER 16.12 
 

FIRE REGULATIONS 
 
Section: 
16.12.010 Fire Inspections; Fees. 
16.12.020 Fire Inspection--Removal of Hazards. 
16.12.030 Obstructing Fire Hydrant. 
16.12.040 Misuse of Equipment. 
16.12.080 Control at Fires. 
 
16.12.010  Fire Inspections; Fees.   

 
(a) It shall be the duty of the chief of the Fire Department to inspect or cause to be inspected by the 

Fire Department officers or members as often as may be necessary, all buildings and premises for the purpose 
of ascertaining and causing to be corrected any condition liable to cause fire, or any violations of the 
provisions or intent of any ordinance of the city affecting the fire hazard. 

 
(b) Fees for Fire Inspections.  No fee shall be charged for an initial inspection.  Fees for fire re-

inspections shall be adopted by the Governing Body of the City by resolution.  (Ord. 08-81 § 1, 2008; Ord. 
93-31 § 1, 1993; Prior code § 6-201.) 
 
16.12.020  Fire Inspection--Removal of Hazards. 
 

(a) Whenever an officer making an inspection under the authority of Section 16.12.010 may find, in 
any building or upon any premises, combustibles endangering any building or premises, the officer shall 
order the same to be removed or remedied, and such order shall be forthwith complied with by the owner or 
occupant of the building or premises; provided, however, that if the owner or occupant deems himself 
aggrieved by such order he may, within ten days, appeal to the state fire marshal, and the order shall remain 
in force unless revoked by an order of the state fire marshal. 
 

(b) It is unlawful for an owner or occupant of a building or premises to fail or refuse to comply with 
such an order after the ten-day appeal period has passed or the state fire marshal has reviewed and upheld the 
order.  (Prior code § 6-202.) 
 
16.12.030  Obstructing Fire Hydrant.  No person shall place or cause to be placed upon or about any fire 
hydrant any rubbish, building material, fence, or other obstruction of any character whatsoever, in any 
manner to obstruct, hinder or delay the Fire Department in the performance of its duties in case of fire; nor 
shall any person hitch or cause to be hitched to any fire hydrant any animal or animals, nor fasten to same 
any guy rope or brace, nor back or stand any wagon, truck, automobile or other vehicle within fifteen feet of 
any such hydrant.  (Prior code § 6-203.)  
 
16.12.040 Misuse of Equipment.  No person or persons shall use any fire apparatus or equipment for any 
private purpose, nor shall any person willfully and without proper authority remove, take away, keep or 
conceal any tool, appliance or other article used in any way by the Fire Department. (Prior code § 6-204.)  
 
16.12.080  Control at Fires. The fire chief or, in his absence, the assistant fire chief (or other ranking officer 
present) shall have full power and command over all persons whatever at fires, and he shall direct and adopt 
any and all measures that he deems most advisable for the extinguishment of such fires, or for the care and 
protection of the property endangered thereby; and he shall have the power if need be, to summon any and all 
persons present to aid in extinguishing any fire or removing or caring for personal property from any building 
on fire or in danger thereof. (Ord. 98-C § 1, 1968; prior code § 6-209.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.13 
October 2008 



CHAPTER 16.14 
 

RECOVERY OF EXPENSES 
 
Sections: 
16.14.010 Definitions. 
16.14.020 The Chief of the Fire Department. 
16.14.030 Liability to Pay Costs Incurred by City. 
16.14.040 Recovery of Expenses. 
16.14.050 Supervision or Verification of Clean Up. 
16.14.060 Remedies not Exclusive. 
16.14.070 Conflict. 
 
16.14.010  Definitions.  For the purposes of this chapter, the words, phrases and terms as used herein are 
defined as set out below: 
 

(a) Emergency action.  Emergency action shall mean all exigent activities conducted in order to 
prevent or mitigate harm to the public health and safety and the environment from a release or threatened 
release of any hazardous material into or upon land, water or air. 
 

(b) "Hazardous material" means waste or combination of wastes or substances which because of its 
quantity, concentration or physical, chemical, biological or infectious characteristics or as otherwise 
determined by the Kansas Secretary of Health & Environment to cause, or significantly contribute to an 
increase in mortality or an increase in serious irreversible or incapacitating reversible illness; or pose a 
substantial present or potential hazard to human health or the environment when improperly treated, stored, 
transported or disposed of or otherwise managed. 
 

(c) Person. Person shall include any individual, corporation, association, partnership, firm, trustee, 
legal representative, or any combination thereof. 
 

(d) Recoverable expenses.  Recoverable expenses shall include those expenses of the City of Olathe 
that are reasonable, necessary and allocable to an emergency action.  Recoverable expenses shall not include 
normal budgeted expenditures that are incurred in the course of providing what are traditionally city services 
and responsibilities, such as routine firefighting protection.  Expenses allowable for recovery may include, 
but are not limited to: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.14 
October 2008 



(1) Disposable materials and supplies consumed and expended specifically for the purpose of 
the emergency action. 

(2) Compensation of employees for the time and efforts devoted specifically to the 
emergency action. 

(3) Rental or leasing of equipment used specifically for the emergency action (e.g., protective 
equipment or clothing, scientific and technical equipment). 

(4) Replacement costs for equipment owned by the city that is contaminated beyond reuse or 
repair, if the equipment was a total loss and the loss occurred during the emergency action (e.g., self-
contained breathing apparatus irretrievably contaminated during the response). 

(5) Decontamination of equipment contaminated during the response. 
(6) Special technical services specifically required for the response (e.g., costs associated 

with the time and efforts of technical experts or specialists not otherwise provided for by the city). 
(7) Other special services specifically required for the emergency action. 
(8) Laboratory costs of analyzing samples taken during the emergency action. 
(9) Any costs of clean up, storage, or disposal of the released material. 
(10) Costs associated with the services, supplies and equipment procured for a specific 

evacuation of persons or property. 
(11) Medical expenses incurred as a result of response activities. 
(12) Legal expenses that may be incurred as a result of the emergency action, including 

efforts to recover expenses pursuant to this chapter. 
 

(e) Release.  Release shall mean any spilling, leaking, pumping, pouring, emitting, emptying, 
discharging, injecting, escaping, leaching, dumping or disposing into or upon land, water or air, of any 
material. 
 

(f) Threatened release.  Threatened release shall mean any imminent or impending event potentially 
causing but not resulting in a release, but causing the city to undertake an emergency action.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 
1989.) 
 
16.14.020  Authority of Fire Chief.  The deputy director of Fire Services is authorized to clean up or abate 
the effects of any emergency action relating to hazardous material unlawfully released, threatened to be 
released, discharged or deposited upon or into any property or facilities within the city.  (Ord. 93-32 § 1, 
1993; Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.030  Liability to Pay Costs Incurred by City.  The following described persons shall be jointly and 
severally liable to the city for the payment of all costs incurred by the city as a result of such clean up or 
abatement activity: 
 

(a) The person or persons whose negligent or willful act or omission proximately caused such 
release, discharge or deposit; 
 

(b) The person or persons who owned or had custody or control of the hazardous materials at the 
time of such release, discharge or deposit, without regard to fault or proximate cause; and 
 

(c) The person or persons who owned or had custody or control of the container which held such 
hazardous materials at the time or immediately prior to such release, discharge or deposit, without regard to 
fault or deposit, without regard to fault or proximate cause.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.040  Recovery of Expenses. 
 

(a) Itemization of Recoverable Expenses.  City personnel and departments involved in an emergency 
action shall keep an itemized record of recoverable expenses resulting from an emergency action.  Promptly 
after completion of an emergency action, the appropriate city department shall certify those expenses to the 
city manager. 
 
 
 
 
 

16.15 
October 2008 



(b) Submission of Claim.  The city shall submit a written itemized claim for the total expenses 
incurred by the city for the emergency action to the responsible person and a written notice that unless the 
amounts are paid in full to the city within thirty (30) days after the date of the mailing of the claim and 
notice, the city will file a civil action seeking recovery for the stated amount. 
 

(c) Lien on Property.  The city may cause a lien in the amount of the recoverable expenses to be 
placed on any real property located within the city owned by the person causing or responsible for the 
emergency action. 
 

(d) Civil Suit.  The city may bring a civil action for recovery of the recoverable expenses against any 
and all persons causing or responsible for the emergency action.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.050  Supervision or Verification of Clean Up.  In the event that any person undertakes, either 
voluntarily or upon order of the deputy director of Fire Services or other city official, to clean up or abate the 
effects of any hazardous materials unlawfully released, discharged or deposited upon or into any property or 
facilities within the city, the deputy director of Fire Services may take such action as is necessary to 
supervise or verify the adequacy of the clean up or abatement.  The persons described in Section 16.14.030 of 
this chapter shall be liable to the city for all costs incurred as a result of such supervision or verification.  
(Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.060  Remedies not Exclusive.  The remedies provided by this chapter shall be in addition to any other 
remedies provided by law.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.070 Conflict.  Nothing in this chapter shall be construed to conflict with state or federal laws requiring 
persons causing or responsible for releases or threatened releases from engaging in remediation activities 
and/or paying the costs thereof  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.16 
October 2008 



16.05.170 Section 310.2 Amended – Prohibited areas.  Section 310.2 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

310.2 Prohibited areas.  Smoking shall be prohibited as set forth in Chapter 6.20 of the Olathe 
Municipal Code. 

 
Exception:  Smoking shall be permitted in approved designated smoking areas as set forth in Chapter 6.20 of 
the Olathe Municipal Code.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.180 Subsection 312.1.1 Added – Protection of utility equipment.  Subsection 312.1.1 is hereby 
added to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

312.1.1 Protection of utility equipment.  Where meters and equipment supplying electricity or fuel 
gas are located adjacent to parking spaces or vehicular driveways, they shall be protected from 
physical damage.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.190 Section 403.3 Amended – Crowd managers.  Section 403.3 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

403.3 Crowd managers.  Trained crowd managers shall be provided for facilities or events where 
more than one thousand (1,000) persons congregate.  The minimum number of crowd managers shall 
be established at a ratio of one crowd manager to every two hundred fifty (250) persons.  Where 
approved by the fire code official, the ratio of crowd managers shall be permitted to be reduced 
where the facility is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system or based upon 
the nature of the event.  The fire code official may, based on the nature of the event, require the event 
to use Fire Department personnel as crowd managers.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.200 Section 503.3 Marking.  Section 503.3 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows: 
 

503.3 Marking.  Where required by the Fire Department, approved signs or other approved notices 
shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction 
thereof.  Signs or notices shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times and be 
replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.   

 
503.3.1 Marking requirements.  Each separate fire lane signage, which may consist of one sign or a 
combination of signs, shall have a cumulative minimum size of ninety six (96) square inches and 
contain the “No Parking” words or symbol with the words “Fire Lane” located directly beneath the 
“No Parking” words or symbol.  Each sign or combination of signs are required to be uniformly 
mounted between two feet eight inches (2’8”) to seven feet zero inches (7’0”) above grade to the 
bottom of the sign, and so located not to obstruct pedestrian traffic.  The sign or combination of signs 
shall be mounted within six feet (6’) of the curb or pavement and are required to face or run parallel 
with oncoming vehicular traffic.  The sign or combinations of signs may be mounted on the building, 
pole base or any other structure provided the signage meets the setback and height requirements 
indicated above.  The sign or combination of signs are required to be spaced no more than one 
hundred feet (100’) apart.  In addition, the curb, or pavement if a curb is absent, is required to be 
marked with a solid yellow stripe that runs the entire length of the fire lane.  Furthermore, the 
exceeding of any standards intended to inform the public of the location of a fire lane shall not affect 
the enforcement of this section.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6 
April 2013 



16.05.210 Subsection 505.1.1 Added – Secondary address numbers.  Subsection 505.1.1 is hereby added 
to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

505.1.1 Secondary address numbers.  Multi-tenant retail shopping centers in which tenant spaces 
have secondary entry doors from the exterior façade of the building and have paved vehicle access 
adjacent to such doors shall have approved numbers or addresses placed on or adjacent to each door.  
Secondary address numbers shall be a minimum of four inches (4”) in height.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 

 
16.05.220 Subsection 507.5.2.1 Added – Hydrants – Color.  Subsection 507.5.2.1 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

507.5.2.1 Hydrants – Color.  All hydrants shall be painted and highly visible.  Private fire hydrants 
shall be painted red in color.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.230 Subsection 901.1.1 Added – Responsibility.  Subsection 901.1.1 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.1.1 Responsibility.  The owner of the protected premises shall be responsible for all fire 
protection systems within the protected premises, whether existing or installed under this code.  (Ord. 
12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.240 Section 901.4 Amended – Installation.  Section 901.4 of the International Fire Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 
 

901.4 Installation.  Fire protection systems shall be maintained in accordance with the original 
installation standards for that system.  All systems shall be extended, altered, or augmented as 
necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever the building is altered, remodeled or added 
to.  Alterations to fire protection systems shall be done in accordance with applicable standards.  
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.250 Subsection 901.4.5 Amended – Appearance of equipment.  Subsection 901.4.5 of the 
International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

901.4.5 Nonoperational equipment.  Any fire protection equipment that is no longer in service shall 
be removed.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.260 Subsection 901.4.7 Added – Existing installations – supervision.  Subsection 901.4.7 is hereby 
added to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.4.7 Existing installations – supervision.  All existing fire suppression and fire alarm systems 
shall be supervised in conformance with Sections 903.4 and 907.9.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.270 Subsection 901.6.3 Added – Test documentation.  Subsection 901.6.3 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.6.3 Test documentation.  When required inspection, testing or maintenance occurs on any 
existing fire protection system, applicable testing documentation shall be submitted to the fire code 
official within thirty (30) days of completion.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.1 
April 2013 



16.05.280 Subsection 901.6.4 Added – Qualifications of inspection, testing and maintenance personnel.  
Subsection 901.6.4 is hereby added to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

901.6.4 Qualifications of inspection, testing and maintenance personnel.  All personnel 
performing any inspection, testing or maintenance of any fire protection system shall be qualified.  
Where such inspection, testing and maintenance is performed by an outside service company, the 
company shall be appropriately licensed in accordance with the Office of the Kansas State Fire 
Marshal.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.290 Subsection 903.4.1 Amended – Monitoring.  Subsection 903.4.1 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

903.4.1 Monitoring.  Alarm, waterflow, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different 
and shall be automatically transmitted to an approved UL-listed central station as defined in NFPA 
72, or, when approved by the fire code official, shall sound an audible signal at a constantly attended 
location.  The fire alarm system installed to transmit such signals shall be considered a building fire 
alarm system and shall be documented as a UL-certificated central station service system. 

 
Exceptions: 
 

1. Underground key or hub valves in roadway boxes provided by the municipality or public 
utility are not required to be monitored.  

 
2. Backflow prevention device test valves located in limited area sprinkler system supply piping 

shall be locked in the open position.  In occupancies required to be equipped with a fire 
alarm system, the backflow preventer valves shall be electrically supervised by a tamper 
switch installed in accordance with NFPA 72 and separately annunciated.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 

 
16.05.300 Subsection 903.4.2 Amended – Alarms.  Subsection 903.4.2 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

903.4.2 Alarms.  One all-weather horn/strobe shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler system 
on the exterior of the building above the Fire Department connection or in an approved location.  
Such sprinkler system water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the 
flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system.  Where a fire alarm 
system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm 
system.  Interior alarm notification appliances shall be installed as required by Section 903.4.2.1. 

 
903.4.2.1 Notification devices.  Where an automatic fire sprinkler system is installed in a building, 
audible and visible notification appliances shall be installed throughout the building as follows: 

 
1. Audible notification appliances shall be installed so as to be audible at 15 dBa above 

sound pressure level throughout the building. 
 
2. Visible notification appliances shall be installed in all public and common use areas, 

restrooms and corridors in accordance with the spacing requirements of NFPA 72. 
 
3. Visible notification devices can be eliminated in normally unoccupied portions of 

buildings where permitted by the fire code official.   
 
Exception:  The requirements of this section do not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.2 
April 2013 



16.05.310 Subsection 907.6.5 Amended - Monitoring.  Subsection 907.6.5 of the International Fire Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 
 

907.6.5 Monitoring.  Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the International Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved supervising station in accordance with NFPA 72.  An 
Underwriters Laboratories (UL) Fire Alarm certificate shall be issued by the UL listed fire alarm 
contractor for all newly installed fire alarm system or existing fire alarm systems included in any 
existing building involved in any construction project involving a building permit.  Any fire alarm 
system involved in one (1) or more false alarms within the same calendar year shall be subject to a 
fee in accordance with Section 16.07.070 of the Olathe Municipal Code.  Any fire alarm system 
involved in four (4) or more false alarms within the same calendar year will be required to meet the 
monitoring requirements of new fire alarm systems, including the issuance of a UL fire alarm 
certificate.  The Fire Department shall maintain a listing of approved UL listed fire alarm contractors. 

 
Exception:  Monitoring by a supervising station is not required for: 
 

1. Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms required by Section 907.2.11. 
 
2. Smoke detectors in Group I-3 occupancies. 
 
3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dwellings.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.320 Subsection 907.7.4 Added – Contractor’s statement.  Subsection 907.7.4 is hereby added to the 
International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

907.4.4 Contractor’s statement.  A contractor’s statement verifying that the system has been 
installed in accordance with the approved plans and specifications and has been one hundred percent 
(100%) tested in accordance with NFPA 72.  The statement will also include that all personnel 
involved with the installation of the fire alarm system meet the qualification requirements of the fire 
code official.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.330 Section 912.2 Amended – Location.  Section 912.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 
 

912.2 Location.  With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, Fire Department 
connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will not 
obstruct access to the buildings for other fire apparatus.  The location of Fire Department 
connections shall be approved by the fire code official.  A Fire Department connection for each 
standpipe system or water-based fire-extinguishing system shall be located not more than one 
hundred feet (100’) from the nearest public fire hydrant connection to an approved water supply.  
Private fire hydrants are not approved to supply water-based fire-extinguishing systems.  (Ord. 12-52 
§ 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.340 Subsection 912.3.4 Added – Fire Department connections.  Subsection 912.3.4 is hereby added 
to the International Fire Code and shall read as follows: 
 

912.3.4 Fire Department connections.  The connection shall be a four inch (4”) Storz quick 
coupling connector.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 

 
16.05.350 Section 1103.2 Deleted – Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings.  Section 
1103.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.360 Section 1103.9 Deleted – Carbon monoxide alarms.  Section 1103.9 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.3 
April 2013 



16.05.370 Section 1104.24 Deleted – Egress path markings.  Section 1104.24 of the International Fire 
Code is hereby deleted.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.380 Establishment of Above Ground Storage of Flammable Liquid Limits.  The limits referred to 
in Subsection 5704.2.9.6.1 of the International Fire Code in which storage of flammable or combustible 
liquids in outside above-ground tanks is prohibited are established as follows: any residential, commercial, or 
M-1 zoning district.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.390 Establishment of Storage of Liquefied Petroleum Gas Limits.  The limits referred to in Section 
6104.2 of the International Fire Code in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted are established 
as follows:  any residential or commercial zoning district.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.400 Establishment of Explosives Storage Limits.  The limits referred to in Subsection 5601.2.3 of 
the International Fire Code in which storage of explosive and blasting agents is prohibited, excepting 
temporary job sites, are as follows:  any residential, commercial, or M-1 zoning district.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 
2012.) 
 
16.05.410 Code Official.  The Fire Chief of the City of Olathe or his or her designee shall be designated the 
enforcement officer of this code and is herein referred to as the fire code official for the purposes of this 
chapter.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.420 Civil Actions.  Notwithstanding the provisions of Section 101.5, the decisions of the Fire Chief or 
the decisions of the Board of Code Review reviewing the decisions of the Fire Chief shall be enforceable in 
the District Court of Johnson County, Kansas, or any other court of competent jurisdiction upon action 
brought by the City Attorney, or such other legal counsel authorized to maintain such action for enforcement 
of the provisions of this chapter.  (Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
16.05.430 Liability.  The requirements stated in this chapter shall not be construed as imposing upon the 
City, its officers, agents or employees any liability or responsibility for damages to any property or injury to 
any person due to defective installations.  The City or any official, employee or agent thereof shall not 
assume liability or responsibility whatsoever by reason of any inspection or approval of any installation.  
(Ord. 12-52 § 1, 2012.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.6.4 
April 2013 



CHAPTER 16.07 
 

AUTOMATIC FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS 
 
 
 

Sections: 
16.07.010 Definitions 
16.07.020 Registration of Fire Alarm Systems 
16.07.030 System Certification 
16.07.040 Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance 
16.07.050 Fire Alarm Activation Response 
16.07.060 Nuisance Fire Alarm 
16.07.070 False or Nuisance Fire Alarm Fees 
16.07.080 Remedies and Penalties 
16.07.090 Appeals 
16.07.100 Reconnection of Fire Alarm System 
16.07.110 Government Immunity 
16.07.120 Severability 
 
16.07.010 Definitions.  For the purposes of this Chapter, the following words and terms shall have the 
following meanings: 

 
A. “Adopted Codes” means codes adopted by the City of Olathe, the National Fire Protection 

Association Fire Alarm Code (NFPA 72) and the International Fire Code (IFC). 
 
B. “Alarm Initiating Device” means a device that is designed to respond either manually or 

automatically to smoke, fire, or activation of a fire suppression system. 
 
C. “Enforcement Official” means the Fire Chief or designated representative. 
 
D. “False Fire Alarm” means the activation of any Fire Alarm System which results in a 

response by the fire department and which is caused by the negligence or intentional misuse of the Fire 
Alarm System by the Owner, its employees, agents, or any other activation of a Fire Alarm System not 
caused by heat, smoke, or fire, exclusive of a Nuisance Fire Alarm. 

 
E. “Fee” means the assessment of a monetary charge payable to the City of Olathe to defray the 

expenses of responding to a False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm. 
 
F. “Fire Alarm Activation Report” means a document issued by the Enforcement Officer 

indicating that the activation was deemed to be a result of a fire alarm activation due to fire, a Nuisance Fire 
Alarm, or a False Fire Alarm. 

 
G. “Fire Alarm Business” means any individual, partnership, corporation, or other entity that is 

appropriately licensed to conduct business in the State of Kansas and installs, causes to be installed, permits 
to be installed, alters, maintains, repairs, replaces, or services (including Runner Services) any Fire Alarm 
System. 

 
H. “Fire Alarm System” means a system or portion of a combination system consisting of 

components and circuits arranged to monitor and/or communicate the status of a fire alarm or supervisory 
signal-initiating devices and to initiate the appropriate response to those signals. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.7 
October 2008 



I. “Fire Watch” means an approved person or persons assigned to the Premises for the purpose 
of protecting the occupants from fire or similar emergencies. A Fire Watch may involve at least some special 
action beyond normal staffing, such as assigning additional staff to walk the Premises, who has been 
specially trained in fire prevention and in the use of fire extinguishers, in notifying the fire department, in 
sounding the Fire Alarm System located on the Premises, and in understanding the particular fire safety 
situation.  

 
J. “Monitored System” means the process by which a Fire Alarm Business receives signals 

from a Fire Alarm System and notifies emergency forces. 
 
K. “Nuisance Fire Alarm” means the activation of any Fire Alarm System, which results in a 

response by the fire department, caused by mechanical failure, malfunction, improper installation, lack of 
proper maintenance, or any other response for which fire department personnel are unable to determine the 
apparent cause of the alarm activation. 

 
L. “Owner” means any person who owns the Premises in which a Fire Alarm System is 

installed or the person or persons who lease, operate, occupy, or manage the Premises. 
 
M. “Premises” means any building, structure, or combination of buildings and structures which 

serve as dwelling units such as single-family, multi-family, or any other area within a building, structure, or 
combination thereof which is used for any purpose, wherein a Fire Alarm System is installed. 

 
N. “Qualified Fire Alarm Technician” means any person who inspects, installs, repairs, or 

performs maintenance on Fire Alarm Systems. This person shall be: a) factory trained and certified, b) 
National Institute of Certification in Engineering Technologies (NICET) Fire Alarm Level II certified, or c) 
employed by a UL UUFX or UUJS listed fire alarm company. 

 
O. “Record of Completion” means the completion of a form equivalent to the record of 

completion form included in the National Fire Protection Association’s National Fire Alarm Code (NFPA 
72). 

 
P. “Registration” means the notification by an Owner to the Enforcement Official that a Fire 

Alarm System has been installed and is in use. 
 
Q. “Report of Service/Repair” means appropriate documentation in a format acceptable to the 

Enforcement Official that verifies proper repairs or maintenance have been performed by both the Fire Alarm 
Business and the Owner. 

 
R. “Runner Service” means the service provided by a runner at the protected premises, 

including resetting and silencing of all equipment transmitting fire alarm or supervisory signals to an off-
premises location. 

 
S. “Serve” shall mean hand-delivery of written notification by a representative of the City of 

Olathe to the Owner or authorized representative who responded to the Premises. In the event the Owner or 
authorized representative fails to respond to the Premises within one (1) hour, Serve shall mean placing the 
form or other matter in the United States mail, postage prepaid, addressed to the Owner or authorized 
representative.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.020 Registration of Fire Alarm System. 
 

A. An annual Registration shall be required for all Fire Alarm Systems and whenever new Fire 
Alarm Systems are installed, in accordance with Adopted Codes. 

 
B. The Owner shall be required to re-register whenever there is a change in the Fire Alarm 

Business responsible for maintaining, servicing, and/or monitoring the Fire Alarm System. 
 
 
 
 

16.8 
October 2008 



C. Registration shall not be transferable from one Premises to another or from one Owner to 
another.  

 
D. Every Fire Alarm Business shall notify the Enforcement Official of the existence of a Fire 

Alarm System prior to the Fire Alarm System being put into service. It shall be the responsibility of the 
installing Fire Alarm Business to provide the Owner with notice of the existence of this Chapter, a 
Registration form and a copy of the Fire Alarm System operation instructions in accordance with Adopted 
Codes, and the manufacturer’s instructions. 

 
E. The Registration form shall include the following information: 

 
1. The name(s), address of the Premises, mailing address (if different from the address 

of the Premises), business and home telephone number of the Owner, lessee, operator, manager, or 
person in possession of the Premises wherein the Fire Alarm System is installed; 

2. The name, address, and telephone number of a minimum of two (2) persons who can 
be notified by the Enforcement Official, in the event of the activation of the Fire Alarm System, who 
shall be capable of responding to the Premises within one (1) hour, and who are authorized to enter 
the Premises to ascertain the status thereof; 

3. The name, address, and telephone number of the Fire Alarm Business which has 
contracted to service the Fire Alarm System and proof of proper qualification with the Enforcement 
Official, if required.  

4. The date the Registration is signed or the Fire Alarm System is placed in operation 
for any reason; and  

5. Any other documentation that is required by Adopted Codes. 
 
F. When any of the information required by this Chapter has changed, it shall be reported to the 

Enforcement Official by the Owner within fifteen (15) days of the Owner becoming aware of such change; 
 
G. The Owner shall complete and deliver the Fire Alarm System Registration in the required 

format to the Enforcement Official before the Fire Alarm System is activated or placed into service. The Fire 
Alarm Business, when authorized by the Owner, may assist the Owner in accomplishing this submission of 
the Fire Alarm Registration to the Enforcement Official. 

 
H. An Owner who does not renew the annual registration shall be subject to a non-renewal fee.  
 
I. The fire alarm registration Fee and non-renewal fee shall be adopted by resolution of the 

Governing Body.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.030 System Certification.  All newly installed or renovated commercial Fire Alarm Systems shall be 
approved by the Enforcement Official. The certification shall indicate that the Fire Alarm System is in 
compliance with Adopted Codes. All new or renovated commercial Fire Alarm Systems shall be certificated 
by Underwriters Laboratories.  (UL)  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.040 Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance. 
 

A. The Owner shall ensure that all Fire Alarm Systems are inspected and tested in accordance 
with Adopted Codes. 

 
B. The Owner shall ensure that all Fire Alarm Systems are periodically maintained per 

manufacturer specifications and Adopted Codes.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.050 Fire Alarm Activation Response. 
 

A. The Owner shall be responsible for the activation of a Fire Alarm System. 
 
 
 
 
 

16.9 
October 2008 



B. A response to the activation of a Fire Alarm System shall result when any officer or member 
of the Fire Department is dispatched to the Premises where the Fire Alarm System has been activated. 

 
1. At the time of the response, the Enforcement Official shall notify any person 

identified in the Registration required by this Chapter and shall require such person to respond to the 
Premises. 

2. In the event the Fire Alarm System is a Monitored System, it is the responsibility of 
the company monitoring the Fire Alarm System to notify any persons identified in the Registration at 
the request of the Enforcement Official. 

3. In the event the Fire Alarm System is a Monitored System, it is the responsibility of 
the Fire Alarm Business to offer the Owner the option to verify the Fire Alarm signal before 
dispatch, as allowed by Adopted Code. 

4. In the event the Fire Alarm System is a Monitored System, it is the responsibility of 
the Fire Alarm Business to forward cancellation of a Fire Alarm signal to the fire department. 

 
C. The officer or member of the fire department who responded to said Premises shall Serve the 

Owner or authorized representative with a Fire Alarm Activation Report.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.060 Nuisance Fire Alarms. 
 

A. In the event the activation of a Fire Alarm System is deemed by the Enforcement Official to 
be a Nuisance Fire Alarm, the Owner shall be Served with a Fire Alarm Activation Report by an officer or 
member of the fire department, indicating that the activation was deemed to be the result of a Nuisance Fire 
Alarm. 
 

1. This shall require the Owner to return the completed Report of Service/Repair within 
fifteen (15) days of receipt of the Fire Alarm Activation Report to verify, to the reasonable 
satisfaction of the Enforcement Official , that: 

 
a. the Fire Alarm System has been examined by a Qualified Fire Alarm 

Technician; and 
b. a bona fide attempt has been made to identify and correct any defect of 

design, installation, or operation of the Fire Alarm System which was identifiable as the 
cause of the Nuisance Fire Alarm. 

 
2. Any owner who fails to return a Report of Service/Repair within said fifteen (15) day 

period, which is reasonably satisfactory to the Enforcement Official, shall be subject to a Fee for the 
Nuisance Fire Alarm.  Such Fee shall be adopted by resolution of the Governing Body.  (Ord. 08-80 
§ 1, 2008) 

 
16.07.070 False Fire Alarm Fees. 
 

A. Newly Installed Fire Alarms. 
 

1. The provisions of this Section shall only apply to any newly installed Fire Alarm 
System after the expiration of a period of thirty (30) days from the date of final inspection, but shall 
apply from and after the expiration of the initial thirty (30) day period following final inspection. 

 
B. False Fire Alarms. 

 
1. The Fire Alarm Business shall be assessed a Fee if an Enforcement Official 

determines that a False Fire Alarm was directly caused by an onsite employee or representative  of 
the Fire Alarm Business. In this event, no False Fire Alarm shall be counted against the Owner. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

16.10 
October 2008 



2. Any Fire Alarm System which has recorded more than one (1) False Fire Alarm 
within a calendar year will be subject to a Fee.  Such Fee shall be adopted by resolution of the 
Governing Body. 

3.  False Fire Alarms activated by any components connected to the Fire Alarm System 
shall be included in computing the total number of False Fire Alarms for purposes of this subsection. 

4.  The activation of a Fire Alarm System will not be considered a False Fire Alarm if 
the alarm is activated due to malicious causes beyond the control of the Owner.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 
2008) 

 
16.07.080 Remedies and Penalties. 
 

A. The Enforcement Official has the authority to order a Fire Watch in accordance with 
Adopted Codes, due to repetitive Nuisance Fire Alarms and/or False Fire Alarms, until corrective action is 
taken for any of the following reasons: 
 

1. Failure to meet all requirements or pay the Fees provided for in this Chapter with 
fifteen (15) days after the notice is mailed to the Owner; 

2. Failure of the Owner to provide a written Report of Service/Repair required by this 
Chapter; 

3. A second False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm at a Premises for which a Fee is 
charged pursuant to this Chapter as a result of the failure of the Owner to take corrective action to 
eliminate the cause of the False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm; or 

4. The failure of a person notified pursuant to Section 16.07.020(E)(2) and Section 
16.07.050(B)(2) to appear within one (1) hour after being notified to respond, if such failure to 
timely respond occurs four or more times within a calendar year. 

 
B. Each building affected because the signal from the Fire Alarm System has been disconnected 

or deactivated shall be required to establish a Fire Watch until the Fire Alarm System has been returned to 
service. Duties of the Fire Watch may include notifying the fire department and building occupants of an 
emergency, preventing a fire from occurring, or extinguishing small fires. These duties shall be documented 
on a Fire Watch log every hour until the Fire Alarm System has been restored to normal service. 
 

C. The Owner is responsible for paying all costs associated with establishing a Fire Watch. 
 
D. The Enforcement Official has the authority to temporarily suspend the occupancy of a 

Premises until all outstanding repairs are made on the Fire Alarm System or if the Fire Watch log is not 
maintained to the satisfaction of the Enforcement Official. 

 
E. The Enforcement Official shall have the authority to direct the Owner of the Premises to 

silence an activated Fire Alarm System, have corrective action taken and thereafter reset it. 
 
F. Anyone convicted of falsifying reports as required under this Chapter is subject to maximum 

penalty in accordance with Section 9.08.090.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.090 Appeals. 
 

A. The Owner or Fire Alarm Business may appeal an assessment of a Fee by setting forth in 
writing the reasons for the appeal within fifteen (15) business days after receipt of the Fee. 

 
B. Filing of a request for appeal shall stay the Fee until the review of the appeal has been 

completed. If a request for appeal is not made within the fifteen (15) business day period, the action of the 
Enforcement Official is final. 

 
C. The Enforcement Official may adjust the count of False Fire Alarms or Nuisance Fire 

Alarms based on: 
 
 
 
 

16.11 
October 2008 



1. Evidence that the alarm was caused by an act of God; 
2. Evidence that the alarm was caused by action of the telephone company: 
3. Evidence that the alarm was caused by a power outage lasting longer than four (4) 

hours; 
4. Evidence that the alarm was not a False or Nuisance Fire Alarm; and/or 
5. In determining the number False or Nuisance Fire Alarms occurring in any twenty 

four (24) hour period shall be counted as one False Fire Alarm or Nuisance Fire Alarm; to allow the 
Owner time to take corrective action unless the alarms are directly caused by the Owner.  (Ord. 08-80 
§ 1, 2008) 

 
16.07.100 Reconnection of Fire Alarm System. 
 

A. A Fire Alarm System may be reactivated upon a finding by the Enforcement Official that the 
Owner of the Premises has taken corrective action to remedy the cause of the False Fire Alarm or Nuisance 
Fire Alarm at the Premises. 

 
B. In making a request for such a reactivation, the Owner shall have the burden of showing what 

corrective action has been made. 
 
C. The Enforcement Official shall have the right to inspect the Fire Alarm System and test it 

prior to approving a new order to reconnect or reactivate the Fire Alarm System. 
 
D. The Enforcement Official shall not approve a new order to reconnect or reactivate if the 

Owner has failed to pay any Fee pursuant to this Chapter.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.110 Government Immunity.  Registration of a Fire Alarm System is not intended to, nor will it, create 
a contract, duty or obligation, either expressed or implied, or response. Any and all liability and 
consequential damage resulting from the failure to respond to a notification is hereby disclaimed and 
governmental immunity as provided by law is retained. When registering a Fire Alarm System, the Owner 
acknowledges that fire department response may be based on factors such as; availability of fire department 
units, priority of calls, weather conditions, traffic conditions, emergency conditions, and staffing levels. The 
City of Olathe, its officers, employees and agents shall not assume any duty or responsibility for the 
installation, maintenance, operation, repair or effectiveness of any privately owned Fire Alarm System, those 
duties or responsibilities being solely those of the Owner of the Premises.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
16.07.120 Severability.  The provisions of this Chapter are severable. If a court determines a word, phrase, 
clause, sentence, paragraph, subsection, section, or other provision invalid or that the application of any part 
of the provision to any person or circumstance is invalid, the remaining provision and the application of those 
provisions to other persons or circumstances are not affected by that decision.  (Ord. 08-80 § 1, 2008) 
 
CHAPTER 16.08.  Life Safety Code.  Repealed  (Ord. 90-36 § 1, 1990; Ord. 86-62 § 1, 2, 1986.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.12 
October 2008 



CHAPTER 16.12 
 

FIRE REGULATIONS 
 
Section: 
16.12.010 Fire Inspections; Fees. 
16.12.020 Fire Inspection--Removal of Hazards. 
16.12.030 Obstructing Fire Hydrant. 
16.12.040 Misuse of Equipment. 
16.12.080 Control at Fires. 
 
16.12.010  Fire Inspections; Fees.   

 
(a) It shall be the duty of the chief of the Fire Department to inspect or cause to be inspected by the 

Fire Department officers or members as often as may be necessary, all buildings and premises for the purpose 
of ascertaining and causing to be corrected any condition liable to cause fire, or any violations of the 
provisions or intent of any ordinance of the city affecting the fire hazard. 

 
(b) Fees for Fire Inspections.  No fee shall be charged for an initial inspection.  Fees for fire re-

inspections shall be adopted by the Governing Body of the City by resolution.  (Ord. 08-81 § 1, 2008; Ord. 
93-31 § 1, 1993; Prior code § 6-201.) 
 
16.12.020  Fire Inspection--Removal of Hazards. 
 

(a) Whenever an officer making an inspection under the authority of Section 16.12.010 may find, in 
any building or upon any premises, combustibles endangering any building or premises, the officer shall 
order the same to be removed or remedied, and such order shall be forthwith complied with by the owner or 
occupant of the building or premises; provided, however, that if the owner or occupant deems himself 
aggrieved by such order he may, within ten days, appeal to the state fire marshal, and the order shall remain 
in force unless revoked by an order of the state fire marshal. 
 

(b) It is unlawful for an owner or occupant of a building or premises to fail or refuse to comply with 
such an order after the ten-day appeal period has passed or the state fire marshal has reviewed and upheld the 
order.  (Prior code § 6-202.) 
 
16.12.030  Obstructing Fire Hydrant.  No person shall place or cause to be placed upon or about any fire 
hydrant any rubbish, building material, fence, or other obstruction of any character whatsoever, in any 
manner to obstruct, hinder or delay the Fire Department in the performance of its duties in case of fire; nor 
shall any person hitch or cause to be hitched to any fire hydrant any animal or animals, nor fasten to same 
any guy rope or brace, nor back or stand any wagon, truck, automobile or other vehicle within fifteen feet of 
any such hydrant.  (Prior code § 6-203.)  
 
16.12.040 Misuse of Equipment.  No person or persons shall use any fire apparatus or equipment for any 
private purpose, nor shall any person willfully and without proper authority remove, take away, keep or 
conceal any tool, appliance or other article used in any way by the Fire Department. (Prior code § 6-204.)  
 
16.12.080  Control at Fires. The fire chief or, in his absence, the assistant fire chief (or other ranking officer 
present) shall have full power and command over all persons whatever at fires, and he shall direct and adopt 
any and all measures that he deems most advisable for the extinguishment of such fires, or for the care and 
protection of the property endangered thereby; and he shall have the power if need be, to summon any and all 
persons present to aid in extinguishing any fire or removing or caring for personal property from any building 
on fire or in danger thereof. (Ord. 98-C § 1, 1968; prior code § 6-209.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.13 
October 2008 



CHAPTER 16.14 
 

RECOVERY OF EXPENSES 
 
Sections: 
16.14.010 Definitions. 
16.14.020 The Chief of the Fire Department. 
16.14.030 Liability to Pay Costs Incurred by City. 
16.14.040 Recovery of Expenses. 
16.14.050 Supervision or Verification of Clean Up. 
16.14.060 Remedies not Exclusive. 
16.14.070 Conflict. 
 
16.14.010  Definitions.  For the purposes of this chapter, the words, phrases and terms as used herein are 
defined as set out below: 
 

(a) Emergency action.  Emergency action shall mean all exigent activities conducted in order to 
prevent or mitigate harm to the public health and safety and the environment from a release or threatened 
release of any hazardous material into or upon land, water or air. 
 

(b) "Hazardous material" means waste or combination of wastes or substances which because of its 
quantity, concentration or physical, chemical, biological or infectious characteristics or as otherwise 
determined by the Kansas Secretary of Health & Environment to cause, or significantly contribute to an 
increase in mortality or an increase in serious irreversible or incapacitating reversible illness; or pose a 
substantial present or potential hazard to human health or the environment when improperly treated, stored, 
transported or disposed of or otherwise managed. 
 

(c) Person. Person shall include any individual, corporation, association, partnership, firm, trustee, 
legal representative, or any combination thereof. 
 

(d) Recoverable expenses.  Recoverable expenses shall include those expenses of the City of Olathe 
that are reasonable, necessary and allocable to an emergency action.  Recoverable expenses shall not include 
normal budgeted expenditures that are incurred in the course of providing what are traditionally city services 
and responsibilities, such as routine firefighting protection.  Expenses allowable for recovery may include, 
but are not limited to: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.14 
October 2008 



(1) Disposable materials and supplies consumed and expended specifically for the purpose of 
the emergency action. 

(2) Compensation of employees for the time and efforts devoted specifically to the 
emergency action. 

(3) Rental or leasing of equipment used specifically for the emergency action (e.g., protective 
equipment or clothing, scientific and technical equipment). 

(4) Replacement costs for equipment owned by the city that is contaminated beyond reuse or 
repair, if the equipment was a total loss and the loss occurred during the emergency action (e.g., self-
contained breathing apparatus irretrievably contaminated during the response). 

(5) Decontamination of equipment contaminated during the response. 
(6) Special technical services specifically required for the response (e.g., costs associated 

with the time and efforts of technical experts or specialists not otherwise provided for by the city). 
(7) Other special services specifically required for the emergency action. 
(8) Laboratory costs of analyzing samples taken during the emergency action. 
(9) Any costs of clean up, storage, or disposal of the released material. 
(10) Costs associated with the services, supplies and equipment procured for a specific 

evacuation of persons or property. 
(11) Medical expenses incurred as a result of response activities. 
(12) Legal expenses that may be incurred as a result of the emergency action, including 

efforts to recover expenses pursuant to this chapter. 
 

(e) Release.  Release shall mean any spilling, leaking, pumping, pouring, emitting, emptying, 
discharging, injecting, escaping, leaching, dumping or disposing into or upon land, water or air, of any 
material. 
 

(f) Threatened release.  Threatened release shall mean any imminent or impending event potentially 
causing but not resulting in a release, but causing the city to undertake an emergency action.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 
1989.) 
 
16.14.020  Authority of Fire Chief.  The deputy director of Fire Services is authorized to clean up or abate 
the effects of any emergency action relating to hazardous material unlawfully released, threatened to be 
released, discharged or deposited upon or into any property or facilities within the city.  (Ord. 93-32 § 1, 
1993; Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.030  Liability to Pay Costs Incurred by City.  The following described persons shall be jointly and 
severally liable to the city for the payment of all costs incurred by the city as a result of such clean up or 
abatement activity: 
 

(a) The person or persons whose negligent or willful act or omission proximately caused such 
release, discharge or deposit; 
 

(b) The person or persons who owned or had custody or control of the hazardous materials at the 
time of such release, discharge or deposit, without regard to fault or proximate cause; and 
 

(c) The person or persons who owned or had custody or control of the container which held such 
hazardous materials at the time or immediately prior to such release, discharge or deposit, without regard to 
fault or deposit, without regard to fault or proximate cause.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.040  Recovery of Expenses. 
 

(a) Itemization of Recoverable Expenses.  City personnel and departments involved in an emergency 
action shall keep an itemized record of recoverable expenses resulting from an emergency action.  Promptly 
after completion of an emergency action, the appropriate city department shall certify those expenses to the 
city manager. 
 
 
 
 
 

16.15 
October 2008 



(b) Submission of Claim.  The city shall submit a written itemized claim for the total expenses 
incurred by the city for the emergency action to the responsible person and a written notice that unless the 
amounts are paid in full to the city within thirty (30) days after the date of the mailing of the claim and 
notice, the city will file a civil action seeking recovery for the stated amount. 
 

(c) Lien on Property.  The city may cause a lien in the amount of the recoverable expenses to be 
placed on any real property located within the city owned by the person causing or responsible for the 
emergency action. 
 

(d) Civil Suit.  The city may bring a civil action for recovery of the recoverable expenses against any 
and all persons causing or responsible for the emergency action.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.050  Supervision or Verification of Clean Up.  In the event that any person undertakes, either 
voluntarily or upon order of the deputy director of Fire Services or other city official, to clean up or abate the 
effects of any hazardous materials unlawfully released, discharged or deposited upon or into any property or 
facilities within the city, the deputy director of Fire Services may take such action as is necessary to 
supervise or verify the adequacy of the clean up or abatement.  The persons described in Section 16.14.030 of 
this chapter shall be liable to the city for all costs incurred as a result of such supervision or verification.  
(Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.060  Remedies not Exclusive.  The remedies provided by this chapter shall be in addition to any other 
remedies provided by law.  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
16.14.070 Conflict.  Nothing in this chapter shall be construed to conflict with state or federal laws requiring 
persons causing or responsible for releases or threatened releases from engaging in remediation activities 
and/or paying the costs thereof  (Ord. 89-68 § 1, 1989.) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

16.16 
October 2008 


	Title 16
	16.05
	16.07
	16.12
	16.14

